
MOTOR TRAFFIC (FURTHER AMENDMENT) 
ACT, 1978, No. 114 

ANNO VICESIMO SEPTIMO 

ELIZABETHE II REGINE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 114, 1978. 
An Act to amend the Motor Traffic Act, 1909, to increase the 

penalties for certain offences against that Act. [Assented to, 
20th December, 1978.] 



BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by 
the authority of the same, as follows :— 

1. This Act may be cited as the "Motor Traffic (Further 
Amendment) Act, 1978". 

2. The Motor Traffic Act, 1909, is amended in the manner 
set forth in Schedule 1. 

SCHEDULE 1. 
AMENDMENTS TO THE MOTOR TRAFFIC ACT, 1909. 

(1) (a) Section 4 (3) ( a )— 
Omit "two hundred dollars", insert instead "$500". 

(b) Section 4 (3) (b )— 

Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead "$1,000". 

(2) (a) Section 4E (1) — 
Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead "$1,000". 

(b) Section 4E (6) — 

Omit "two hundred dollars", insert instead "$500". 

(c) Section 4E (7 )— 

Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead "$1,000". 

(3) Section 5 (2)— 

Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead "$1,000". 



SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE MOTOR TRAFFIC ACT, 1909—continued. 

(4) Section 7A (2)— 
Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead " $ 1 , 0 0 0 " . 

(5) Section 7B (1)— 

Omit "two hundred dollars", insert instead " $ 5 0 0 " . 

(6) Section 7c (2) — 

Omit "two hundred dollars", insert instead " $ 5 0 0 " . 

(7) Section 8 (2)— 

Omit "four hundred dollars", insert instead " $ 1 , 0 0 0 " . 

( 8 ) (a) Section 1 0 (1)-

Omit "two hundred dollars", insert instead " $ 5 0 0 " . 

(b) Section 1 0 (2) — 

Omit "eighty dollars", inset instead " $ 2 0 0 " . 


