BUILDERS LICENSING (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1984, No. 107

Heiw South Thlales

ANNO TRICESIMO TERTIO

ELIZABETHZA I REGINAE

de ok M5 ok e A s ok ok %k ok sk ok ok ok ok ok K sk ok %k ok ok ok % ok ok kR K ok sk ok ok ok ok ok %k

Act No. 107, 1984,

An Act to amend the Builders Licensing Act, 1971, in relation to insurance
and other matters; to amend the Builders Licensing (Amendment) Act,
1976, so as to enable certain insurance claims to be satisfied; and for
certain other purposes. [Assented to, 28th June, 1984.]



2 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice
and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative Assembly of New
South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same,
as follows:—

Short title.

1. This Act may be cited as the “Builders Licensing (Amendment) Act,
1984”.

Commencement.

2. (1) Except as provided by subsections (2) and (3), this Act shall
commence on the date of assent to this Act.

(2) Section 6 shall be deemed to have commenced on 1st March,
1977.

(3) The several provisions of Schedules 1-4, and section 5 in its
application to those provisions, shall commence on such day or days as may

be appointed by the Governor in respect thereof and as may be notified by
proclamation published in the Gazette.

Principal Act.

3. The Builders Licensing Act, 1971, is referred io in this Act as the
Principal Act.
Schedules,

4. This Act contains the following Schedules:—

SCHEDULE 1..—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO TRADE INDEMNITY INSURANCE.

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO SUBPOENAS.



Act No. 107, 1984. 3

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 3.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO APPEALS.

SCHEDULE 4.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES.

SCHEDULE 5.—MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
ACT.

SCHEDULE 6.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF
STATUTE Law REVISION.

SCHEDULE 7.—SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS.

Amendment of Act No. 16, 1971.

5. The Principal Act is amended in the manner set forth in Schedules
I-6.

Amendment of Act No. 22, 1976.
6. The Builders Licensing (Amendment) Act, 1976, is amended by

inserting in section Il (1) (b) after the word “completed” the words
“before, on or”.

Savings, transitional and other provisions.

7. Schedule 7 has effect.




Act No. [07. 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1.
(Sec. 5.)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE.
(1) (a) Section 32 (2) (a)—
Omit the paragraph, insert instead:—

(a) in the case of—

(i) a contract undertaking to carry out, by the person
or by others, any building work referred to in
paragraph (a) of that subsection—within |
month after entering into that contract; or

(ii) a contract undertaking to carry out, by the person
or by others, any trade work referred to in
paragraph (a) of that subsection~—within 7 days
after entering into that contract; or

(b) Section 32 (2)—
After “that building work™ where secondly occurring, insert “or
trade work, as the case may be”.

(c) Section 32 (2A)—

After “building work™ where firstly oceurring, insert “or trade
work”.

(2) (a) Section 34 (2) (¢) (ii)—

Omit “to the dwelling caused by that defect”, insert instcad
“caused by that defect to any dwelling comprising or in which
is comprised that building work”.

(b) Section 34 (2) (c¢) (iii)—
Omit “the foregoing provisions of this paragraph™, insert instead
“subparagraph (i) or (i)™

(¢) Section 34 (2) (e) (1)—

Omit “(1) or (ii) or (¢)7, insert instead “or (¢) (1) or (ii)”.



Act No. 107, 1984, 5

Builders Licensing { Amendment).

SCHEDULE |—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

(d) Section 34 (23)—

Omit “(ii)", insert instead “under a provision of a house
purchaser’s agreement referred to in subsection {2} (b) (ii),”.

(e) Section 34 (2a)—
After section 34 (3), insert:—

{3a) In any proceedings for the recovery of an amount paid
by the Board under a house purchaser’'s agreement ibeing an
amount not exceeding $1,000 or. where some other amount is
prescribed, being an amount not exceeding the amount so
prescribed ) —

(a) a certificate. in or to the effect of the prescribed form,
under the hand of the Chairman or Deputy Chairman
certifying, in respect of a specified defect in specitied
building work—

(i) that a specified manner of rectifying the defect
was, at the time the defect was rectified, a
reasonable manner of rectifying the defect: and

(ii) that a specified cost was, at the time the cost was
incurred, a cost reasonably incurred in rectifying
the defect in the manner so specified,

is conclusive evidence of the matters so certified: and

{b) where—

(i) a certificate referred to in paragraph {a) has
been lodged with the court before which the
proceedings are taken; and

(ii) a copy of the certificate has been served on the
person against whom the proceedings are taken,



6 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE —continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

the Board shall not be required to furnish to the court,
nor to any party to the proceedings, any particulars
concerning the defect specified in the certificate, being
particulars relating solely to—

(iii) the question of whether the manner so specified
was, at the time the defect was rectified, a reason-
able manner of rectifying the defect; or

(iv) the question of whether the cost so specified was,
at the time the cost was incurred, a cost reason-
ably incurred in rectifying the defect in the
manner so specified,

notwithstanding any other Act or law, or any rule or
practice of the court, to the contrary.

(3) Section 34A—
After section 34, insert:—
Trade indemnity insurance,

34a. (1) The Board shall, whether or not the provisions of section
32 have been complied with, be deemed to have entered into an
agreement, to be called a trade indemnity agreement, with every
person for whom trade work is to be or has been carried out pursuant
to a contract referred to in section 32 (1) (a).

(2) The trade indemnity agreement shall be in or to the
effect of the prescribed form and shall contain provisions—

(a) for or with respect to insuring the person for whom trade work
has been carried out, or has been undertaken to be
carried out, against any costs and expenses reasonably in-
curred by that person in commencing or continuing proceed-
ings in respect of the bankruptcy of the individual or the
winding up (whether compulsory or voluntary) or dissolution
of the corporation or partnership by whom or by which the
trade work was carried out or undertaken to be carried out;



Act No. 107, 1984. 7

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE——continued.

(b) where

the trade work undertaken to be carried out under a

contract referred to in section 32 (1) (a) has not been

comm
pleted

enced or, having been commenced, has not been com-
and the contract has been rescinded or determined

otherwise than by reason of the fault of the person for whom
the work was undertaken to be carried out, for or with respect
to insuring that person for an amount—

(1)

(i)

(c¢) for or

being the amount by which any consideration paid in
money, together with the value of any other considera-
tion conveyed, to the holder of the licence who
undertook to carry out the trade work under the
contract exceeds the value of any trade work carried
out, when the contract was rescinded or determined,
by that holder in performance or part performance
of that contract; or

being the amount which is the cost of completion of
the trade work reduced by that person’s remaining
liability under the contract immediately before its
rescission or determination;

with respect to insuring the person for whom the trade

work was carried out or undertaken to be carried out—

(1)

(ii)

against any loss or expenses reasonably incurred by
that person in rectifying any defect in the trade work
due to the trade work having been carried out other-
wise than in a good and workmanlike manner, due to
the use of faulty or unsuitable materials, due to the
trade work having been carried out in contravention
of any Act, regulation, by-law, ordinance or rule
applicable to the carrying out of the work or due to
any departure from the requirements of the contract
referred to in section 32 (1) (a) in respect of the
trade work;

against any loss or expenses reasonably incurred by
that person in rectifying any major structural defect in
the trade work and in making good any damage



Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment .

SCHEDULE —continued.

AMENDMENTS TG THE PRINCIPAL ACY IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

caused by that defect to any building comprising or
in which is comprised the trade work; and

(iit} against such other risks as may be specified in the
form of trade indemnity agreement whether of the
same Kind as, or of a different kind to, those referred
to in paragraph (a) or (b) or subparagraph (i) or
(ii);

(d) for or with respect to the resolution of any dispute between
the Board and the person for whom trade work was carried
out, or undertaken to be carried out, arising under the trade
indemnity agreement; and

(e) applying the insurance cover referred to in—

(i) paragraph (a), (b) or (¢) (1) or (il) to any matter
so referred to only if notice in writing of a claim is
received by the Board within such period as may be
specified in the trade indemnity agreement in respect
of that cover or within such longer period as to the
Board seems just in the circumstances of the particular
case; or

(1i) paragraph (c¢) (iii) to any risk so referred to only
in such circumstances and for such period as may be
specified in the trade indemnity agreement in respect
of that cover,

and may contain provisions—
(f) specifving—
(13 in respect of any building: or

(i1) in respect of any class of persons carrying out trade
work,

the maximum liability of the Board under the trade indemnity
agreement or any provision thereof: or



Act No. 107, 1984. 9

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL. ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

(g) for excluding the Board’s liability in respect of such risks and
to such extent as may be specified in the trade indemnity
agreement.

(3) For the purpose of subsection (2) (b) (ii), the cost of
completion of trade work shall be deemed to be the reasonable cost of
completing that work reduced by, where the reasonable cost of carry-
ing out the trade work under the contract for that work exceeds the
contract price under the rescinded or determined contract, the
difference between that reasonable cost and that price.

(4) A person is entitled to claim an amount referred to in
subsection (2) (b) for which the person is insured either under a
provision of a trade indemnity agreement referred to in subsection
(2) (b) (i) or under a provision of a trade indemnity agreement
referred to in subsection (2) (b) (ii). at the person’s option. but
not under both of those provisions.

(5) For the purpose of determining the liability of the
Board in respect of any claim made under a trade indemnity agreement
in respect of any trade work, any provision of a contract for the
carrying out of that trade work requiring any claim in respect of that
trade work to be submitted to arbitration shall be disregarded.

(6) Any amount paid by the Board under a trade indemnity
agreement in respect of any trade work may be recovered by the
Board in a court of competent jurisdiction as a debt from the person
by whom the trade work was carried out, or undertaken to be carried
out, or out of the estate of that person from that person’s personal
representative.

(7) In any proceedings for the recovery of an amount paid
by the Board under a trade indemnity agreement (being an amount not
exceeding $1,000 or, where some other amount is prescribed, being
an amount not exceeding the amount so prescribed)—



10

Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE

(a)

(b)

INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

a certificate, in or to the effect of the prescribed form, under
the hand of the Chairman or Deputy Chairman certifying.
in respect of a specified defect in specified trade work—

(i) that a specified manner of rectifying the defect was,
at the time the defect was rectitied, a reasonable
manner of rectifying the defect; and

(ii) that a specified cost was, at the time the cost was
incurred, a cost reasonably incurred in rectifying the
defect in the manner so specified,

is conclusive evidence of the matters so certified; and

where—

(i) a certificate referred to in paragraph (a) has been
lodged with the court before which the proceedings
are taken: and

(ii) a copy of the certificate has been served on the person
against whom the proceedings are taken.

the Board shall not be required to furnish to the court, nor
to any party to the proceedings, any particulars concerning
the defect specified in the certificate. being particulars relating
solely to—

(iii) the question of whether the manner so specified was,
at the time the defect was rectified, a reasonable
manner of rectifying the defect; or

(iv) the question of whether the cost so specified was, at
the time the cost was incurred, a cost reasonably
incurred in rectifying the defect in the manner so
specified.

notwithstanding any other Act or law, or any rule or practice
of the court. to the contrary.

(8) Notwithstanding any other provision of this section, a

person is not entitled to the benefit of a trade indemnity agreement
in respect of trade work carried out when the person—



Act No. 107, 1984. 11

Builders Licensing (Amendment}.

SCHEDULE 1——continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

(a) was the holder of—
(i) a full licence;

(ii) a restricted licence authorising the person to carry out
that trade work; or

(iii) an owner-builder’s permit; or
(b) was a person on whose behalf—
(i) a subsidiary full licence; or

(ii) a subsidiary restricted licence authorising the carrying
out of that trade work,

was then held.

(4) Section 35 (1)—

After “agreements”, insert “and trade indemnity agreements”.

(5) (a) Section 36—

Omit “of section 34”7, insert instead “sections 34 and 34A”.

(b) Section 36 (a)—

After “building work”, insert “or trade work”.

(6) (a) Section 41—

After “section 35" wherever occurring, insert “relating to house
purchasers’ agreements”.

(b) Section 41 (2) (a)—

After “Part VI”, insert “(otherwise than in connection with
trade indemnity agreements)”.



12 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

(7) (a) Section 41a (1) (b)—
Omit “and”.

{b) Section 41a (1) (¢c)—

Omit “41B.”, insert instead “41B;”.

(c) Section 41a (1) (d), (e)—
After section 41a (1) (c¢), insert:—

(d) all moneys recovered by the Board under section 34A
(6); and

(e) all moneys received from the underwriters by virtue of
any arrangement or contract mentioned in section 35
relating to trade indemnity agreements.

(d) Section 41A (3)—

Omit “either or both”, insert instead “any”.

(e) Section 41A (3) (b)—

Omit “fit.”, insert instead “fit;”.

(f) Section 41a (3) (¢)-(e)—
After section 41a (3) (b), insert:—

{c¢) meeting the expenses, as determined by the Board, of
administering Part VI in connection with trade indemnity
agreements;

(d) wmaking payments under trade indemnity agreements
referred to in section 34A;



Act No. 107, 1984. 13

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO TRADE
INDEMNITY INSURANCE—continued.

(e) payment of amounts payable to underwriters by virtue
of any arrangement or contract mentioned in section 35
relating to trade indemnity agreements.

(8) Section 60 (2)—

After “Board”, insert *, or for the recovery of any amount recoverable
by the Board pursuant to section 34 (3) or 34a (6),”.

SCHEDULE 2.
(Sec. 5.0
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION 10 SUBPOENAS.

(1) Section29 (1)—

(i} Omit “member or members before whom an inquiry under
this Part is held may of its or his or their”, insert instead “any
member may, in relation to any inquiry under this Part, of
the Board's or the member’s”.

(i1) After “produce at”. insert “or before”.

(2) Section 29 (3) (a)--

Omit “member or members on its or his or their”, insert instead
*a member on the Board’s or the member’'s”,



14 Act No. 107, 1984,

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO SUBPOENAS—continued.

(3) Section 29 (3) (b)—

Omit “member or members”, insert instead “"a member”.

(4) Section 29 (4), (5)—
After section 29 (3), insert:—

(4) Upon application by the Board or any member, the Supreme
Court may—

(a) order a person who has failed or refused to obey a subpoena
served in accordance with subsection (2) to obey the subpoena
within such period as may be specified in the order; and

(b) if the Court is satisfied that the person does not have a
reasonable excuse for having failed or refused to obey the
subpoena, punish the person in like manner as if the person
had been guilty of contempt of the Court.

(5) The Supreme Court may make an order under subsection
(4) (a) in relation to a person whether or not the person has been
convicted of an offence against subsection (2) arising from the
person’s failure or refusal to obey a subpoena served in accordance
with subsection (2).




Act No. 107, 1984. R

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 3.
(Sec. 5.)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO APPEALS.

(1) (a) Section 30 (2)—

After “effect until”™, insert “21 days after™.

(b) Section 30 (2)—

Omit "and the time limited for appealing against the Board's
determination has expired and”, insert instead “or”.

(2) (a) Section 31 (I)=(lp)—

Omit section 31 (1), insert instead:—

(1) Any applicant for a licence or permit, or for the
restoration or variation of a licence, who is aggrieved by any
determination of the Board in relation to the application may
appeal against the determination to the District Court—

(a) within 21 days after notice of the determination is served
on the applicant: or

(b) in the case of a determination referred to in subscction
(6)—within 21 days after the date on which that
determination is deemed to have been made,

whichever is the later.

(1a) Any defendant under Part 1V who is aggrieved by any
determination of the Board made under section 30 upon the
inquiry at which that person was the defendant may appeal
against the determination to the District Court within 3 months
after notice of the determination is served on that person.

(1B) An appeal under subsection (1A) may not, except by
leave of the District Court, be made by any person against a
determination referred to in that subsection later than 21 days
after notice of the determination is served on that person.



16 Act No. 107, 19§4.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION TO
APPEALS—continued.

(1c) The District Court shall not grant leave as referred to in
subsection (1B) unless it is satistied that—

(a) therc has been no undue delay in the making of the
appeal; or

{b) it would be unjust, in the circumstances of the case, to
refuse leave to appeal.

(D) Any holder of a full licence or a restricted licence who
is aggrieved by any determination of the Board to impose a
condition on the licence or to vary or revoke a condition imposed
on the licence for the time being by the Board may appeal
against the determination to the District Court within 21 days
after notice of the determination is served on that holder.

(b) Section 31 (2), (3). (4;—

Omit “such appeal” wherever occurring, insert instead “appeal
under subsection (1), (1a) or (ID)”.

SCHEDULE 4.
(Sec. 5

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES.
(1) Section 10 (3)—(6)—
After section 10 (2), insert: —
(3) An application for a full hicence or a subsidiary full licence

shall specify the period (either | year or 3 years) for which the
applicant intends that the licence, if granted, shall be in force.



Act No. 107, 1984. 17

Builders Licensing (Amendment),

SCHEDULE 4—-continued.

AMENDMIEN'!'S TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES—contined.

(4) The Board may, for such reasons as it may decide, refuse to
determine an application for a full licence or a subsidiary full licence
which specifies 1 year as the period for which the applicant intends
that the licence. if granted, shall be in force.

(5) Where the Board refuses to determine an application for a
full licence or a subsidiary full licence, it shall notify the applicant
of the reasons for its refusal and refund to the applicant any fee
which has been paid by the applicant in respect of the application.

(6) A refusal by the Board to determine an application for a full
licence or a subsidiary full licence does not constitute a determination
of the Board for the purposes of section 31.

(2) Scction 13¢ (4)-(7)—

After section 13c (3), insert:—

(4) Anapplication for a restricted licence or a subsidiary restricted
licence shall specify the period (either 1 year or 3 years) for which
the applicant intends that the licence, if granted. shall be in force.

(5) The Board may, for such reasons as it may decide, refuse to
determine an application for a restricted licence or a subsidiary
restricted licence which specifies 1 year as the period for which the
applicant intends that the licence, if granted. shall be in force.

(6) Where the Board refuses to determine an application for a
restricted licence or a subsidiary restricted licence. it shall notify the
applicant of the reasons for its refusal and refund to the applicant
any fee which has been paid by the applicant in respect of the
application.

(7) A refusal by the Board to determine an application for a
restricted licence or a subsidiary restricted licence does not constitute
a determination of the Board for the purposes of section 31.



Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing ( Amendment).

SCHEDULE 4——continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES—continued.

(3) (a) Section 14—

Omit “a period of one year from the date of the licence”, insert
instead “‘such period commencing on the date on which the
licence is granted (not being a period exceeding the period
specified in the application for the licence) as the Board may
determine”.

(b) Section 14 (2)—

At the end of section 14, insert:—

(2) Where the Board determines that a licence granted under
section 11, 12, 13, 13p, 13E or 13F shall be in force for a lesser
period than the period specified in the application for the licence,
the Board shall refund to the applicant a proportion of the fee
paid by the applicant under section 10 or 13c, as the case may
be, equivalent to the proportion, represented by that lesser
period, of the period so specified.

(4) (a) Section 15 (24)—(2D)—

After section 15 (2), insert:—

(2a) An application for renewal of a licence shall specify
the period (either 1 year or 3 years) for which the applicant
intends that the licence, if renewed, shall be in force.

(2B) The Board may, for such reasons as it may decide,
refuse to determine an application for renewal of a licence which
specifies 1 year as the period for which the applicant intends that
the licence, if renewed, shall be in force.

(2¢) Where the Board refuses to determine an application
for renewal of a licence, it shall notify the applicant of the
reasons for its refusal and refund to the applicant any fee which
has been paid by the applicant in respect of the application.



Act No. 107, 1984. 19

Builders Licensing (Amendment),

SCHEDULE 4—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES—continued.

(2D) A refusal by the Board to determine an application for
renewal of a licence does not constitute a determination of the
Board for the purposes of section 31.

(b) Section 15 (4) (a)—

Omit “a further period of one year commencing on the date of
expiry”, insert instead “such period commencing on the date of
expiry (not being a period exceeding the period specified in the
application for renewal of the licence) as the Board may
determine”.

(c¢) Section 15 (4) (b) (it)—

Omit “the period of one year commencing on the date of expiry”,
insert instead “such period commencing on the date of expiry
(not being a period exceeding the period specified in the applica-
tion for renewal of the licence) as the Board may determine”.

(d) Section 15 (5)—

After section 15 (4), insert: —

(5) Where the Board determines that a licence renewed
under this section shall be in force for a lesser period than the
period specified in the application for renewal of the licence,
the Board shall refund to the applicant a proportion of the fee
paid by the applicant under subsection (2) equivalent to the
proportion, represented by that lesser period, of the period so
specified.

(5) (a) Section 15a (2A)—(2D)—
After section 15a (2), insert:—
(2A) An application for restoration ot a licence shall specify

the period (either 1 year or 3 years) for which the applicant
intends that the licence, if restored. shall be in force.



Act No. 107, 1984,

Builders Licensing (Amendment).,

SCHEDULE 4-—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF [LICENCES—continued.

(2B) The Board may. for such reasons as it may decide,
refuse to determine an application for restoration of a licence
which specifies 1 year as the period for which the applicant
intends that the licence, if restored. shall be in force.

(2¢c) Where the Board refuses to determine an application
for restoratior of a licence, it shall notify the applicant of the
reasons for its refusal and refund to the applicant any fee which
has been paid by the applicant in respect of the application.

(2p) A refusal by the Board to determine an application for
restoration of a licence does not constitute a determination of
the Board for the purposes of section 31,

(b) Section 15a (5)—

Omit “the period of one year”, insert instead “such period”.

(¢) Section 15A (5)—

After “force” where Jastly occurring, insert "{not exceeding ihe
period specified in the application for restoration of the licence)
as the Board may determine”.

(d) Section 154 (54)—

After section 15 (5), insert:—

(5A) Where the Board determines that a licence restored
under this section shall be in force for the remaining portion of a
lesser period than the period specified in the application for
restoration of the licence. the Board shall refund to the applicant
a proportion of the fec paid by the applicant under subsection
(2} equivalent to the proportion. represented by that lesscr
period, of the period so specified.



Act No. 107, 1984. 21

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 4—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT IN RELATION
TO THE DURATION OF LICENCES-—continued.

(6) Section 15—

Omit the section.

SCHEDULE 5.
(Sec. 5.)

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.

(1) (a) Section 3 (1), definition of “approved”—

After the definition of “accommodation premises”. insert:—

“approved” means approved for the time being by the Board;

(b) Section 3 (1), definition of “director”—

Omit the definition, insert instead:—

“director”. in relation to a corporation, includes—

(a) any person occupying or acting in the position
of director of the corporation, by whatever name
called and whether or not validly appointed to
occupy or duly authorised to act in the position;
and

(b)Y any person in accordance with whose directions
or instructions the directors of the corporation
are accustomed to act;

(2) Sections 10 (2). 13c¢ (3). 13G (2). 15 (2). 154 (2), 16 (2). 17.
26 (1), 32 (4), 33 (1)—

Omit “prescribed form™ wherever occurring, insert instead “approved
form™.



22 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE S——continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT—continued.

(3) Section 15A (1)—

After “may”, insert ., within | year after that date,”.

(4) Section 17 (2)—

At the end of section 17. insert:—

(2) Where a licence ceases to be in force and an application for
renewal of that licence is not made before the date on which the
licence ceases to be in force, the person who held the licence shall
forthwith after the licence ceases to be in force deliver the licence
to the Board.

Penalty (subsection (2)): $500.

(5) (a) Section 24 (b) (i)—

After “hold a licence”, insert ", is disqualified from being, or is
otherwise not a fit and proper person to be, a director of a
corporation which is the holder of a licence”.

(b) Section 24 (b) (ii)—

After “hold a licence”. insert “or has a director who is
disqualified from being, or is otherwise not a fit and proper
person to be. a director of a corporation which is the holder of a
licence”.

(¢) Section 24 (¢). (d)—

Omit the paragraphs, insert instead: —

(¢) the person on whose behalf a subsidiary full licence or a
subsidiary restricted licence is held—
(i) has been guilty of conduct which, if that person
had been the holder of a full licence or a
restricted licence. would have amounted to
improper conduct:



Act No. 107, 1984. ’ 23

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 5—-continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT—continued.

(i) is not a fit and proper person to have a subsidiary
full licence or a subsidiary restricted licence, as
the case may be, held on that person’s behalf;

(iii) is disqualified from being, or is otherwise not a
fit and proper person to be, a director of a
corporation which is the holder of a licence; or

(iv) is not of good character; or

(d) a director of a corporation which is the holder of a
licence (not being a director on whose behalf a sub-
sidiary full licence or a subsidiary restricted licence, as
the case may be, is held by the corporation)—

(i) is disqualified from holding a full licence or a
restricted licence or from being a person on whose
behalf a subsidiary full licence or a subsidiary
restricted licence may be held;

(ii) is disqualified from being, or is otherwise not a
fit and proper person to be, a director of a
corporation which is the holder of a licence; or

(ii1) is not of good character.

(6) (a) Section 25 (1) (b)—

Omit “and is not a person who is the holder of a licence or on
whose behalf a”, insert instead “, but is no longer a person on
whose behalf the”.

(b) Section 25 (1) (¢)—

Omit “a licence and is not a director of a corporation that holds
a licence, or the holder of a licence”, insert instead “, and still
holds. a licence, but is no longer a director of the corporation”.

(¢) Section 25 (2) (b)—

Omit “or”.



24 Act No. 107, 1984,

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE S—-continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT—continued.

(d) Section 25 (2) (¢)—

Omit “licence.”, insert instead “licence; or”.

(e) Section 25 (2) (d)—
After section 25 (2) (c), insert:—

(d) a former licensee is disqualified from being, or is other-
wise not a fit and proper person to be, a director of a
corporation which is the holder of a licence.

(7) (a) Section 28 (3) (b) (ia)—
After section 28 (3) (b) (1), insert:—

(ia) subject to subsection (3A), may cause the notice served
on the defendant under section 27 (1) or (3), as the
case may be, to be amended by the inclusion therein of
such additional grounds upon which the defendant is
required to show cause as, after consideration of the
evidence or of any other matter, it or he or she thinks
fit or they think fit;

(b) Section 28 (3) (b) (v)—
After “on oath”, insert “and may administer an oath to any
person by whom evidence is so required to be given”.
(¢) Section 28 (3aA)—
After section 28 (3), insert:—
(3a) Where the Board or member or members before whom
an inquiry is held causes or cause a notice served on a defendant

under section 27 (1) or (3) to be amended as referred to in
subsection (3) (b) (ia)—



Act No. 107, 1984. 25

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 5-—continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT—continued.

(a} the defendant may apply for the inquiry to be adjourned
for such period, not exceeding 21 days, as is specified in
the application; and

(b) the Board or member or members before whom the
inquiry is being held shall thereupon adjourn the inquiry
for the period so specified.

(8) (a) Section 30 (1) (d) (i)—
Omit “or” where lastly occurring.

(b)Y Section 30 (1) (d) (iii)—
After section 30 (1) (d) (ii), insert:—

(iii) being a director of a corporation which is the holder of a
licence; or

{c) Section 30 (1) (e) (ili)—
Omit “or” where lastly occurring.
(d) Section 30 (1) (e) (iv)—
Omit “held,”, insert instead “held; or”.

(e) Section 30 (1) (e) (v)—
After section 30 (1) (e) {iv), insert:—

(v) being a director of a corporation which is the holder of a
licence,

(f) Section 30 (ip)—
After section 30 (lc), insert:—
(1p} The Board may make a determination under subsection

(1) (d) (iiiy or (1) (e) (v) whether or not the defendant is a
director of a corporation which is the holder of a licence.



26 Act No. 107, 1984,

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL AcCT—continued.
(9) (a) Section 32 (1) (b)—
Omit “or trade work, as the case may be,”.
(b) Section 32 (1) (e)—

Before “before”, insert “in the case of any building work referred
to in paragraph (a) or (b),”.

(10) Section 38A (1)—

After “building work”, insert “or trade work”.

(11) (a) Section 38c (1)—

Omit “a form approved by the Board”, insert instead “the
approved form”.

(b) Section 38c (1)—

Omit “by the Board” where secondly occurring.

(12) Section 50 (1A)—

Omit “the Chairman or Deputy Chairman, or to each of them”, insert
instead “any member of the Board, or to any servant of the Board”.

(13) (a) Section 53 (d)—
Omit “or” where lastly occurring.
(b) Section 53 (e)—

Omit “dwelling.”, insert instead “dwelling; or”.



Act No. 107, 1984. 27

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL AcCT-—continued.

(c) Section 53 (f)—

After section 53 (e), insert:—

(f) where the information consists of—

(1) any record made as a consequence of an
inspection, carried out by a servant of the Board,
of building work or trade work; or

(ii) any opinion formed by a servant of the Board,
as a consequence of such an inspection, in
relation to any such building work or trade work,

for the purposes of any legal proceedings relating to that
work or any report of any such proceedings.

SCHEDULE 6.
(Sec. 5.)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF
STATUTE LAw REVISION.

(1) Long title—

Omit “, corporations and firms”, insert instead “and corporations”.

(2) (a) Section 3 (1), definition of “accommodation premises”—

Omit “Liquor Act, 1912”, insert instead “Liquor Act, 1982”.
(b) Section 3 (1), definition of “building work”—
After “‘purposes of” in paragraph (a), insert “paragraph (a) or (b) of”.

(c) Section 3 (1), definition of “Crown lands"—

From paragraph (a), omit “subsection (1) of section 5”, insert instead
“section 5 (1)".



28 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 6—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF
STATUTE LAw REVISION—continued.
{d) Section 3 (1), definition of “purchaser”—

(i) From paragraph {a), omit “paragraph {(a) of subsection (1) of
section 32", insert instead “section 32 (i) (a)”.

{11 From paragraph (b). omit “that fand:”. insert nstead “that land;
£

or .

(iit) From paragraph (c), omit “paragraph (b) of subsection (1) of
section 327, insert instead “‘section 32 {1) (h)".

{iv) From paragraph tc}), omit “subsection 21 of section 33", insert
instead “section 23 (2;".

(3) Section 4 (83—

Omit “paragraph (c¢) or (d) of subsecuion (1) of section 57, insert instead
“section 5 (1) (¢) or (d)".

(4) Section 12 (1) (f)—

After “applied or”, insert “is not”.

(5) Section 20—

Omit “Five hundred dollars™, insert instead “$3007.

(6) ta) Section 21 {1)—
Omit “Five hundred dollars™, fnsert instead “$5007,
{b) Section 21 (2)—

Omit “One hundred dollars”, insert instead “$100™.

(7) (a) Section 26 (2}—
Omit by a member”, insert instead “by an  officer or ilemporary
empiovee”,
(bt Section 26 {2, —

Omit such a member™  insert ostewd “such an officer. temperary
cmpdonee™.



Act No. 107, 1984. 29

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 6—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF
STATUTE LAw REVisSION—continued.

(8) Section 28 (3) (b) (ii)—

Omit “or a member”, insert instead “or an officer or a temporary employee”.

(9) Section 29 (2)—

Omit “Two hundred dollars”, insert instead “$200",

(10) Section 31 (5)—

Omit “Five hundred dollars”, insert instead “$500”.

(11y (a) Section 32 (2)—

Omit “Five hundred dollars”. insert instead “$500.

(b) Section 32 (3)—

Omit “Two thousand dollars”, insert instead “$2,000".

(12) Section 33 (4), (5)—

Omit “Five hundred dollars” wherever occurring, insert instead “$500".

(13) (a) Section 34 (1)—-

Omit “paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section 32", insert instead
“section 32 (1) (a)”.

(b) Section 34 (1)—

Omit “paragraph (b) of that subsection”, insert instead “section 32

(1) (b)™.
(¢) Section 34 (1)—

Omit “subsection (2) of section 33", insert instead ‘‘section 33 (2)".

(14) (a) Section 36—

Omit “subsections (2) and (3) of section 32, subsection (5) of section 337,
insert instead ‘“section 32 (2) and (3). section 33 (5)".



30

Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

(15)

(16)

(17)

(18)

(19)

(20)

(21)

(22)

SCHEDULE 6—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF
STATUTE LAw REVISION—continued.

(b) Section 36 (b) (ii)—

Omit “subsection (2) of section 33", insert instead “section 33 (2)”.

Section 40 (3)—

Omit “Revenue”.

Section 41 (1) (b)—

Omit “subsection (3) of section 34”, insert instead “section 34 (3)”.

Section 45 (1)—

Omit “work or to”, insert instead “‘work, or to”.

Section 47 (2)—

Omit “Five hundred dollars”, insert instead “$500".

Section 50 (1A)—

Omit ‘“Part IV or”, insert instead “Part IVa or”.

Section 51 (2)—

Omit “One thousand dollars”, insert instead “$1,000".

Section 52 (2)—

Omit “One thousand dollars”, insert instead “$1,000”.

Section 53—

Omit “One thousand dollars™, insert instead “$1.000”.

Section 55 (1)—

Omit “subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b)”, insert instead “‘paragraph
(i) "

(b)



Act No. 107, 1984. 31

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 6—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(24) Section 61 (1)—

Omit “the thirtieth day of” wherever occurring, insert instead “30th”.

(25) (a) Section 62 (2)—
Omit “two hundred dollars”, insert instead “$200.
(b) Section 62 (2)—

Omit “fifty dollars”, insert instead “$50”.

SCHEDULE 7.
(Sec. 7.)

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS.
Interpretation.

1. Except in so far as the context or subject-matter otherwise indicates or requires,
expressions used in this Schedule have the same meanings as they have in the
Principal Act.

Claims.

2. (1) In this clause, “appointed day” means the day appointed and notified under
section 2 (3) in respect of Schedule 1 (2).

(2) A claim in relation to building work which was made before the appointed
day under a house purchaser’s agreement in force, or purporting to be in force, under
section 34 of the Principal Act, being a claim which was, immediately before that day,
neither determined nor withdrawn, shall (where some other house purchaser’s agree-
ment relating to that building work is in force on that day under section 34 of the
Principal Act, as amended by this Act) be dealt with in accordance with that other
agreement as if that other agreement had been in force when the claim was made.

(3) A payment which was made by the Board before the appointed day in
relation to a claim made under a house purchaser’s agreement in force, or purporting
to be in force, under section 34 of the Principal Act is, to the extent (if any) to
which the payment was invalidly made. hereby validated.



32 Act No. 107, 1984.

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 7—-continued.

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS—continued.

(4 Where, before the appointed day, the Board has made a payment in full
satisfaction, or purporting to be in full satisfaction. of a claim made under a house
purchaser’s agreement in force. or purporting to be in force, under section 34 of the
Principal Act, the Board shall not be required to make any further payment in relation
to that claim and no proceedings shall lie against the Board in respect of any such
further payment.

(5) Notwithstanding section 43 (1) (b) of the Interpretation Act, 1897, any
right, privilege, obligation or liability which was acquired, accrued or incurred in
relation to building work before the appointed day under a house purchaser’s agreement
in force, or purporting to be in force, under section 34 of the Principal Act, being
a right, privilege, obligation or liability in respect of which no claim was made before
that day, is (where some other house purchaser’s agreement relating to that building
work is in force on that day under section 34 of the Principal Act, as amended by
this Act) extinguished.

Appeals,

3. (1) In this clause, “appointed day” means the day appointed and notified under
section 2 (3) in respect of Schedule 3.

(2) An appeal which was made before the appointed day under section 31 (1)
(a), (b) or (c) of the Principal Act, and which was, immediately before that day,
neither determined nor withdrawn, shall be deemed to be an appeal under section 31
(1Y, (1a) or (Ip), as the case may be, of the Principal Act. as amended by this
Act,

Applications.

4. (1) In this clause, “appointed day™ meuns the day appointed and notified under
section 2 (3) in respect of Schedule 4.

{2) An application which was made before the appointed day under section 10,
F3c. 15 or 154 of the Principal Act, and which was, immediately before that day,
neither determined nor withdrawn. shall be determined us if this Act had not been
enacted.

Regulations.

S. (1) The Governor may make regulations contuining other provisions of a savings
or transitional nature consequent on the enactment of this Act.



Act No. 107, 1984, 33

Builders Licensing (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 7

continued.

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS—continued.

72) A provision made under subclause (1) may take effect as from the date of
assent to this Act or a later date.

(3) To the extent to which a provision referred to in subclause (1) takes effect
from a date that is earlier than the date of its publication in the Gazette, the provision
does not operate so as

(a) to aflect, in a manner prejudicial to any person {other than the State or an
authority of the State), the rights of that person existing before the date of
its publication therein; or

{b) to impose liabilities on any person {other than ihe Staic or an authority of
the State) in respect of anything done or omitted to be done before the date
of its publication therein.

¢4) A provision made under subclanse (1) shall, if the regulaiions expressly so
provide, have effect notwithstanding the foregoing clauses of this Schedule,




