
M A C Q U A R I E U N I V E R S I T Y ( A M E N D M E N T ) A C T , 
1980 , N o . 1 0 1 

ANNO VICESIMO NONO 

ELIZABETHE II REGINE 

Act N o . 1 0 1 , 1980 . 

An Act to amend the Macquarie University Act, 1964, with respect 
to the delegation of powers and functions of the Council of 
the University; and for certain other purposes. [Assented to, 
1st May, 1980.] 



BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by 
the authority of the same, as follows :— 

1. This Act may be cited as the "Macquarie University 
(Amendment) Act, 1 9 8 0 " . 

2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— 

SCHEDULE 1 . — A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE 
UNIVERSITY A C T , 1 9 6 4 . 

SCHEDULE 2 . — A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE 
UNIVERSITY A C T , 1 9 6 4 , BY WAY OF STATUTE L A W 
REVISION. 

3. The Macquarie University Act, 1 9 6 4 , is amended in the 
manner set forth in Schedules 1 and 2. 

4. Any delegation made under section 22 of the Macquarie 
University Act, 1 9 6 4 , as in force immediately before the com­
mencement of this Act, shall be deemed to have been made under 
that section, as amended by this Act. 



A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY A C T , 1 9 6 4 . 

(1) Section 3, definitions of "Academic Senate" and "by-laws"— 

Omit the definition of "By-laws", insert instead :— 

"Academic Senate" means the Academic Senate of the 
University constituted in accordance with the by­
laws; 

"by-laws" means the by-laws made under this Act; 

(2) Section 22 (1)-

Omit the subsection, insert instead :— 

(1) The Council may, in relation to any matter or class 
of matters, or in relation to any activity or function of the 
University, by resolution, delegate any or all of its powers 
or functions under this Act (except this power of delega­
tion and its powers in relation to the making of by-laws) 
t o — 

(a) any member of the Council; 

(b) any committee of the Council; 

(c) the Academic Senate; 

(d) any committee of the Academic Senate; or 

(e) any officer or officers of the University. 

(3) Section 23 (1) ( f ) , ( f 1 ) — 

Omit section 23 (1) ( f ) , insert instead :— 

(f) the constitution, powers and functions of a body to 
be called the Academic Senate or of committees 
of the Council or Academic Senate; 

90245 H-2/4 

SCHEDULE 1. 



SCHEDULE I—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY 
A C T , 1964—continued. 

(f1) the convening and holding of meetings of, and the 
conduct of proceedings of, the Academic Senate 
or of any committee of the Council or Academic 
Senate; 

(4 ) Section 23A— 

After section 23, insert :— 

23A. Without limiting the generality of section 23 (1) 
( f ) — 

(a) the Academic Senate may, if the by-laws so 
provide, be constituted so as to include among 
its members, persons who are not members of 
the Council; and 

(b) a committee of the Council or Academic Senate 
may, if the by-laws so provide, be constituted so 
as to include among its members, persons who 
are not members of the Council or Academic 
Senate. 

(5) Section 31 (1)-

Omit the subsection, insert instead :— 

(1) The Council shall allow such persons as are— 

(a) teachers in schools established under the Public 
Instruction Act of 1880 or members of the 
Public Service of New South Wales approved 
by the Minister; 



SCHEDULE I—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY 
A C T , 1964—cont inued. 

(b) qualified in such manner as may be prescribed 
by the by-laws to be enrolled as students of the 
University; 

(c) selected by the University for admission to the 
University; and 

(d) not otherwise excluded from the University, 

to attend University lectures, or to enrol as external 
students, for the purpose of proceeding to a first degree 
and to receive tuition for the period required for admission 
to that degree without payment of lecture, class or tuition 
fees. 

SCHEDULE 2. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY A C T , 1 9 6 4 , BY 
WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION. 

( 1 ) Section 3, definition of "Council"— 

Omit "University.", insert instead "University;". 

(2) (a ) Section 8 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "Act:", insert instead "Act.". 

(b) Section 8 ( 1 ) , proviso—-

Omit the proviso. 



SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY A C T , 1964, BY 
WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION—continued. 

(3) Section 10 ( 1 1 ) — 

Omit "three years", insert instead "3 years". 

(4) Section 12 ( c ) — 

Omit "three consecutive meetings", insert instead "3 
consecutive meetings". 

(5) (a) Section 15 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "and the first Chancellor shall be elected by the 
persons referred to in subsections (2) to ( 9 ) , both 
inclusive, of section 10, and subsequent Chancellors", 
insert instead "who". 

(b) Section 15 ( 2 ) — 

Omit "three years", insert instead "3 years". 

(6) Section 16 ( 2 ) — 

Omit "one year", insert instead "1 year". 

(7) Section 21 (1) (g ) , proviso— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "21 years". 

(8) Section 24 ( 1 ) , ( 2 ) — 

Omit "the first day of January" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "1st January". 



SCHEDULE 2—-continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY A C T , 1 9 6 4 , BY 
WAY OF STATUTE L A W REVISION—continued. 

( 9 ) Section 2 6 — 

Omit "the thirty-first day of December", insert instead "31st 
December". 

(10) (a ) Section 28 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "the thirty-first day of December", insert instead 
"31st December". 

(b) Section 28 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "twelve months", insert instead "12 months". 


