
G A M I N G A N D B E T T I N G (POKER MACHINES) 
A M E N D M E N T A C T , 1977 

ANNO VICESIMO SEXTO 

ELIZABETHE II REGINE 

Act N o . 2 , 1977 . 

An Act to reduce the license tax and the additional supple­
mentary license tax payable by clubs under the Gaming 
and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; 
and to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, 
consequentially. [Assented to, 10th March, 1977.] 

BE 



" B E it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows:— 

1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting 
(Poker Machines) Amendment Act, 1 9 7 7 " . 

2. The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation 
Act, 1 9 5 6 , is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. 

3 . The Gaming and Betting Act, 1 9 1 2 , is amended in 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2 . 

SCHEDULE 1. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION A C T , 1 9 5 6 . 

( 1 ) Section 5 A ( 2 ) , ( 3 ) — 

Omit the subsections, insert instead :— 

( 2 ) The license tax (in this subsection referred to 
as "the full license tax") which would, but for this sub-
section and section 3, be payable by a club in relation 
to a license under Part I I I A of the Gaming and 
Betting Act, 1 9 1 2 , in respect of the period of 1 2 
months (in this subsection referred to as "the relevant 
period") ending 30th June in 1 9 7 7 , or in any subse­
quent year, shall be reduced, where the net takings 

SCHEDULE 



SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
M A C H I N E S ) TAXATION A C T , 1956—continued. 

from poker machines derived by the club during the 
period of 12 months ending 31st May in the relevant 
period from the keeping, use or operation of poker 
machines— 

(a) do not exceed $30,000—by 7 5 % of the 
full license tax; 

(b) exceed $30,000 but do not exceed 
$50,000—by— 

(i) 5 0 % of the full license tax; or 

(ii) 7 5 % of the full license tax, less one 
dollar for every dollar by which 
those net takings exceed $30,000, 

whichever is the greater; 

(c) exceed $50,000 but do not exceed 
$100,000—by— 

(i) 2 5 % of the full license tax; or 

(ii) 5 0 % of the full license tax, less one 
dollar for every dollar by which 
those net takings exceed $50,000, 

whichever is the greater; or 

(d) exceed $100,000—by 2 5 % of the full 
license tax, less one dollar for every dollar 
by which those net takings exceed $100,000. 

(3) Where a club is entitled to a reduction under 
subsection (2) as well as to a reduction under section 
3 the reduction under subsection (2) shall be first 
applied to determine the amount of license tax upon 
which the reduction under section 3 shall operate. 

SCHEDULE 



SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

SCHEDULE 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
M A C H I N E S ) TAXATION A C T , 1956—cont inued. 

( 2 ) (a ) Section 6 ( 1 ) — 

Omit "seventy-five", insert instead "seventy-
seven". 

(b) Section 6 ( 1 ) , Schedule— 

Omit " 3 % " wherever occurring, insert instead 
"21/2%". 

(c) Section 6 ( 1 ) , Schedule— 

Omit " 6 % " wherever occurring, insert instead 
" 5 % " . ' 

(d) Section 6 ( 1 ) , Schedule— 

Omit " 1 2 % " wherever occurring, insert instead 
" 1 0 % " . 

(e) Section 6 ( 1 ) , Schedule— 

Omit " 1 4 % " , insert instead " 1 1 . 6 7 % " . 

SCHEDULE 2 . 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE GAMING AND BETTING A C T , 1 9 1 2 . 

( 1 ) Tenth Schedule— 

Omit " 3 % " , insert instead "21/2%". 

( 2 ) Tenth S c h e d u l e -

Omit " 6 % " , insert instead " 5 % " . 



SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

A M E N D M E N T S TO THE GAMING AND BETTING A C T , 1 9 1 2 
—continued. 

(3) Tenth Schedule— 

Omit " 1 2 % " , insert instead " 1 0 % " . 

(4) Tenth Schedule— 

Omit " 1 4 % " , insert instead "11 .67%". 


