GAMING AND BETTING (AMENDMENT) ACT.

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHA 11 REGINA

%k % K %k ok k ok ¥ k Kk ok ok ook k ok ok ok ok sk ok ok ok ok ok k k ok ok ok ok ok ok ox

Act No. 81, 1973.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet
or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1

BE

1047



1048
Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

No. 81, 1975 E it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
_ and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in:

Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

follows:—
Short 1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting:
title. (Amendment) Act, 1975”.
Amend- 2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended im

t .
yves N(:,f, 25, the manner set forth in Schedule 1.
1912,

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS To THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1—
Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.
(2) (a) Section 10, short heading—

Omit “infants”, insert instead ‘‘persons under
the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 10 (a)—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18&
years”.

SCHEDULE



1049
Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1-—continued. No. 81, 1975

AMENDMENTS TOo THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(3) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

(4) Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

(5) Section 14—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

6) (a) Section 47F—

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

(b) Section 47F—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

INDUSTRIAL



