STATUTE LAW (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 1985
No. 231

Nefo South Wales

ANNO TRICESIMO QUARTO
ELIZABETHA 11 REGINA

* x %

Act No. 231, 1985

An Act to repeal certain Acts and amend certain other Acts in various
respects and for the purpose of effecting statute law revision; and to
make certain savings. [Assented to, 18th December, 1985.]

See also Subordinate Legislation (Repeal) Act 1985.



2 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with the
advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative Assembly of
New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the
same, as follows:

Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the “‘Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions)
Act 1985”.

Commencement

2. (1) Except as provided by this section, this Act shall commence on
the date of assent to this Act.

(2) Section 5, in its application to a provision of Schedules 6, 7, 8, 9 (7),
11, 14, 18, 19 (2), 22, 23 and 24, shall commence on the day on which the
provision commences.

(3) The repeal of the Ministers of the Crown Act 1959 by this Act shall
take effect on such day as may be appointed by the Governor and notified
by proclamation published in the Gazette.

(4) The several provisions of Schedules 6, 7, 8 and 22 shall commence
on such day or days as may be appointed by the Governor and notified by
proclamation published in the Gazette.

(5) Schedule 9 (7) shall, if the date of assent to this Act is earlier than
the day appointed and notified under section 2 (3) of the Fisheries and
Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1979 for the commencement of Schedule
4 (15) (a) to that Act, commence on the day so appointed and notified.

(6) Schedules 11, 14 and 18 shall commence on the day fixed by
Proclamation for the purposes of section 2 (2) of the Australian Citizenship
Amendment Act 1984 of the Commonwealth.

(7) Schedule 19 (2) shall, if the date of assent to this Act is earlier than
the day appointed and notified under section 2 (2) of the Pastures Protection
(Amendment) Act 1985 for the commencement of Schedule | to that Act,
commence on the day so appointed and notified.



3

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

(8) Schedule 23 shall, if the date of assent to this Act is earlier than the
day appointed and notified under section 2 (2) of the Public Notaries Act
1985 for the commencement of that Act (other than sections 1, 2 and 13),
commence on the day so appointed and notified.

(9) Schedule 24 shall, if the date of assent to this Act is earlier than the
day appointed and notified under section 2 (2) of the Second-hand Dealers
and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1985 for the commencement of Schedule
1 (5) (e) to that Act, commence on the day so appointed and notified.

Schedules
3. This Act contains the following Schedules:

SCHEDULE 1—REPEALS

SCHEDULE 2—AMENDMENT TO THE ART GALLERY OF NEW
SOUTH WALES ACT 1980

SCHEDULE 3—AMENDMENTS TO THE CONVEYANCING ACT
1919

SCHEDULE 4—AMENDMENTS TO THE DE FACTO RE-
LATIONSHIPS ACT 1984

SCHEDULE 5—AMENDMENTS TO THE DORMANT FUNDS
ACT 1942

SCHEDULE 6—AMENDMENTS TO THE FAMILY PROVISION
ACT 1982

SCHEDULE 7—AMENDMENT TO THE FILM AND VIDEO TAPE
CLASSIFICATION ACT 1984

SCHEDULE 8—AMENDMENTS TO THE FIREARMS AND
DANGEROUS WEAPONS ACT 1973

SCHEDULE 9—AMENDMENTS TO THE FISHERIES AND
OYSTER FARMS ACT 1935

SCHEDULE 10—AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916

SCHEDULE 11—AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERPRETATION
ACT 1897

SCHEDULE 12—AMENDMENT TO THE JURY ACT 1977

SCHEDULE 13—AMENDMENTS TO THE LANDLORD AND
TENANT (RENTAL BONDS) ACT 1977



4 ' Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 14—AMENDMENTS TO THE LOCAL GOVERN-
MENT ACT 1919

SCHEDULE 15—AMENDMENT TO THE MOTOR DEALERS ACT
1974

SCHEDULE 16—AMENDMENTS TO THE NECROPOLIS ACT
1901

SCHEDULE [7—AMENDMENT TO THE NOXIOUS INSECTS
ACT 1934

SCHEDULE 18—AMENDMENTS TO THE PARLIAMENTARY
ELECTORATES AND ELECTIONS ACT 1912

SCHEDULE 19—AMENDMENTS TO THE PASTURES PRO-
TECTION ACT 1934

SCHEDULE 20—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRISONS ACT 1952

SCHEDULE 21—AMENDMENTS TO THE PROBATION AND
PAROLE ACT 1983

SCHEDULE 22—AMENDMENT TO THE PUBLIC HEALTH ACT
1902

SCHEDULE 23—AMENDMENT TO THE PUBLIC NOTARIES
ACT 1985

SCHEDULE 24—AMENDMENT TO THE SECOND-HAND
DEALERS AND COLLECTORS (AMENDMENT) ACT 1985

SCHEDULE 25—AMENDMENT TO THE STAMP DUTIES ACT
1920

SCHEDULE 26—AMENDMENT TO THE STOCK DISEASES ACT
1923

SCHEDULE 27—AMENDMENTS TO THE SURVEYORS ACT
1929

SCHEDULE 28—AMENDMENT TO THE TRUSTEE COMPANIES
ACT 1964

SCHEDULE 29—AMENDMENTS TO THE VALUERS REG-
ISTRATION ACT 1975

SCHEDULE 30—AMENDMENT TO THE WELLINGTON
SHOWGROUND ACT 1929



5

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF
STATUTE LAW REVISION

SCHEDULE 32—SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER
PROVISIONS

Repeals and amendment of Acts No. 33, 1965, and No. 63, 1976
4. (1) Each Act specified in Schedule 1 is repealed.

(2) So much of the—

(a) Statute Law Revision Act 1976 as relates to the Naturalization
and Denization Act of New South Wales 1898; and

(b) Second Schedule to the Decimal Currency Act 1965 as relates to
the Argentine Ant Eradication Act 1962,

is repealed.

Amendments

5. Each Act specified in Schedules 2-31 is amended in the manner set
forth in those Schedules.

Savings, transitional and other provisions
6. Schedule 32 has effect.

SCHEDULE 1|
(Sec. 4)
REPEALS

Naturalization and Denization Act of New South Wales 1898 No. 21
Statute Law Revision Act 1898 No. 28

Truck Act Amendment Act of 1901 No. 49

Administration Amending Act 1906 No. 14

Sydney Harbour Trust and Navigation Amendment Act 1908 No. 34
Justices (Amendment) Act 1909 No. 24

Diseased Animals and Meat Amendment Act 1910 No. 8

Fire Brigades Amendment Act 1910 No. 15



6 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1 —continued
REPEALS—continued

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1912 No. 6

University (Amendment) Act 1912 No. 52

Senators’ Elections (Amendment) Act 1912 No. 75

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1912 (1913 No. 1)
Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1913 No. i4

Crown Lands and Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1914 No. 10
State Debt and Sinking Fund (Amendment) Act 1914 No. 11
Sydney Harbour Trust (Wharfage and Harbour Rates) Act 1914 No. 12
Inscribed Stock (Renewals) Amendment Act 1914 No. 30

Motor Traffic Amendment Act 1915 No. 11

State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1915 No. 36

Height of Buildings (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 1

Qaths (Amendment) Act 1916 No. §

Public Works (Costs) Act 1916 No. 6

Crown Lands Amendment Act 1916 No. 29

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 37
Government Railways (Appeals) Act 1916 No. 43

Water (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 48

City and Suburban Electric Railways (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 50
Sydney Harbour Tonnage Rates Act 1916 No. 62

Crown Lands Further Amendment Act 1916 No. 66

Liquor (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 68

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1916 No. 69
Navigation (Amendment) Act 1917 No. 5

Banks and Bank Holidays (Amendment) Act 1917 No. 8

Life, Fire, and Marine Insurance (Amendment) Act 1917 No. 23
Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment) Act 1917 No. 24
Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1917 No. 27

Government Railways (Superannuation Amendment) Act 1918 No. 30



7

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE l—continued
REPEALS—continued

Justices (Bail) Amendment Act 1918 No. 32

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1918 No. 35

Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1918 No. 38

Parliamentary Elections (Amendment) Act 1918 No. 40
Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1918 No. 44

Truck (Amendment) Act 1918 No. 47

Bills of Sale (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 17

Judges Retirement (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 22

Water (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 25

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 29

Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 30

Housing (Extension) Act 1919 No. 31

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 40

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 44

Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment) Act 1919 No. 5!
Sydney Harbour Wharfage and Tonnage Rates (Amendment) Act 1920 No. 8
Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1920 No. 16

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1920 No. 26

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1920 No. 38

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1920 No. 44

Real Property (Amendment) Act 1921 No. 3

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1921 No. 19
Evidence (Amendment) Act 1922 No. 3

Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment) Act 1922 No. 5
Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1922 No. 15

Public Works (Amendment) Act 1922 No. 19

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1922 No. 20

Local Government (Validation and Amendment) Act 1922 No. 29
Government Railways (Supply of Electricity) Act 1922 No. 33



8 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Voluntary Workers (Soldiers’ Holdings) Amendment Act 1922 No. 40
Crown Lands Amendment (Disposal) Act 1923 No. 6

Public Trustee (Amendment) Act 1923 No. 13

Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1923 No. 15

Anglican Church of Australia Trust Property (Amendment) Act (No. 2) 1923 No.
28

Necropolis (Amendment) Act 1923 No. 30

Registration of Stock Brands (Amendment) Act 1923 No. 53
Water (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 4

Sydney Corporation (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 7

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 16

Architects (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 29

Stamp Duties (Further Amendment) Act 1924 No. 32
University Amendment (Vice-Chancellor) Act 1924 No. 35

Public Works (Country Towns Water Supply and Sewerage) Amendment Act 1924
No. 40

Co-operation, Community Settlement, and Credit (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 45
Local Government (County Councils) Amendment Act 1924 No. 48
Irrigation Holdings (Freehold) Act 1924 No. 51

Crown Lands and Closer Settlement (Amending) Act 1924 No. 52
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 70

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1924 No. 73

Motor Vehicles (Taxation) Management Act 1924 No. 76
Prickly-pear (Amendment) Act 1925 No. 4

Banks and Bank Holidays (Amendment) Act 1925 No. 10

Public Works Committee Act 1925 No. 11

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1925 No. 17
Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment) Act 1925 No. 19
Crimes Amendment Act 1926 No. 4



9

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1926 No. 6
Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1926 No. 17

Local Government Amendment (Preference to Australian and Empire Goods) Act
1926 No. 20

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 4

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 15

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 16

Totalizator {Amendment) Act 1927 No. 19

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 23

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 3!

Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 32
Gaming and Betting (Night Betting) Amendment Act 1927 No. 54
Women’s College (Amendment) Act 1927 No. 55

Compensation to Relatives (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 8
Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 10
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 18

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 37

Public Loans (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 43

Sydney Harbour Trust (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 46
Returned Soldiers’ Settlement (Amendment) Act 1928 No. 49
Crimes (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 2

Matrimonial Causes (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 5§

Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 9

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 13
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 14

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 15

Public Works (Port Kembla Electricity) Act 1929 No. 18
Crimes (Further Amendment) Act 1929 No. 26

Constitution (Legislative Council) Amendment Act 1929 No. 28



10 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Crimes (Intimidation and Molestation) Act 1929 No. 31

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1929 No. 33
Crimes (Fraudulent Misappropriation) Act 1929 No. 39

Co-operation (Further Amendment) Act 1929 No. 61

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 4

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 6
Prickly-pear (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 13

Racecourses Admission Tax (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 28
Government Insurance (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 30

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1930 No. 39

Inscribed Stock (Issue and Renewals) Amendment Act 1931 No. |
Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 4
Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 8

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 13

Opticians (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 16

Justices (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 17

Government Savings Bank Acts Amendment Act 1931 No. 37

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 41

Rating (Exemption) Act 1931 No. 65

Moratorium and Interest Reduction (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 66
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 67

Sydney Harbour Trust (Amendment) Act 1931 No. 69

Flour Acquisition (Further Amendment) Act 1931 No. 70

Sancta Sophia College Incorporation (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 6
Public Health (Inspectors’ Salaries) Amendment Act 1932 No. 13
Sydney Corporation (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 23

State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 36

Cattle Slaughtering and Diseased Animals and Meat (Amendment) Act 1932 No.
38



i1

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Local Government (Bush Fires) Amendment Act 1932 No. 41

Flour Acquisition (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 44

Gaming and Betting (Reduction of Racing Days) Amendment Act 1932 No. 46
Wills Probate and Administration (Amendmn:ent) Act 1932 No. 49
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 50

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 51

Sydney Harbour Bridge (Rates) Act 1932 No. 52

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 53

Local Government (Small Holdings) Amendment Act 1932 No. 61
Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 65

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1932 No. 66

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1933 No. 12

Fines and Penalties (Amendment) Act 1933 No. 15

Flour Acquisition (Amendment) Act 1933 No. 18

Finances Adjustment (Further Provisions) Act 1933 No. 19

Royal Commissions (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 8

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 11

Police Offences Amendment (Drugs) Act 1934 No. 16

Printing and Book Purchasers’ Protection (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 19
Guardianship of Infants Act 1934 No. 20

Government Railways (Further Powers) Act 1934 No. 28

Anzac Memorial (Building) Amendment Act 1934 No. 32

Prickly-pear (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 34

West Scholarships (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 37

Flour Acquisition (Amendment) Act 1934 No. 46

Government Railways (Free Passes) Amendment Act 1934 No. 47
Public Hospitals (Further Amendment) Act 1934 No. 49

State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 2

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 4



12 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Crown Lands, Closer Settlement and Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment)
Act 1935 No. 6

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 8

Swine Compensation (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 10

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 12

Police Regulation (Amendment} Act 1935 No. 13

Farmers’ Relief Amendment (Debts Adjustment) Act 1935 No. 18
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 20

Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 22

Local Government (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1935 No. 24
Australian Jockey Club (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 29

Public Works (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 30

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 31
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 33

Forestry (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 35

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 36

Navigation (Wireless Telegraphy) Amendment Act 1935 No. 44
Local Government (Further Amendment) Act 1935 No. 50

Flour Acquisition (Amendment) Act 1935 No. 52

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Capital Indebtedness) Act 1935 No.
54

Co-operation (Further Amendment) Act 1935 No. 55

Constitution {Amendment) Act 1936 No. 1

Public Trustee (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 2

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 8

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 10

Oaths (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 12

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 19
Public Instruction and University (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 21



13

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Trade Union (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 23
Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 25

Newcastle Agricultural, Horticultural, and Industrial Association (Amendment) Act
1936 No. 28

Farmers’ Relief Amendment (Debts Adjustment) Act 1936 No. 38
Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 40

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 50

Gas and Electricity (Further Amendment) Act 1936 No. 51
Demise of the Crown (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 55
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 58

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1936 No. 61
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 3

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 9
Finances Adjustment Act 1937 No. 16

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 19

Sale of Goods (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 23

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 26

Housing (Further Provisions) Act 1937 No. 27

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 29

Racing (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 39

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1937 No. 43

Theatres, Public Halls and Cinematograph Films Act 1937 No. 44
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1938 No. §

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 6

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 7
Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 12
Finances Adjustment Act 1938 No. 13

Local Government (City of Parramatta) Act 1938 No. 16
Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries Act 1938 No. 18



14 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Life, Fire and Marine Insurance (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 21
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 24

Bills of Sale (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 27

Crown Lands and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 29
Conveyancing, Trustee and Probate (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 30
Industrial Arbitration and Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1938 No. 36
Public Health (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 1

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 5

Monopolies (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 6

Parliamentary Evidence (‘Amendment) Act 1939 No. 8

Inclosed Lands Protection (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 9

Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 16
Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 18

Greater Newcastle (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 24

Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 28

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 30

Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 32

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 33

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 39

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 42

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1939 No. 44

Justices (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 6

Evidence (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 8

Administration of Justice Act 1940 No. 11

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 14

Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 15

Local Government (Regulation of Flats) Act 1940 No. 16

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 17

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 27



15

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Trustee and Wills (Emergency Provisions) Act 1940 No. 32

Local Government (Elections) Act 1940 No. 39

Drainage (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 41

Workmen’s Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1940 No. 43
Real Property (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 45

Transport (Division of Functions) Amendment Act 1940 Nc 46
Youth Welfare Act 1940 No. 48

Local Government (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1940 No. 49
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1940 No. 50

Superannuation (War Service) Amendment Act 1940 No. 53

Returned Sailors and Soldiers’ Imperial League of Australia (New South Wales)
Incorporation Amendment Act 1941 No. 2

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1941 No. 15
Water Supply to Hospitals Act 1941 No. 18

Maritime Services (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 19

Farms Purchase Promotion Act 1941 No. 20

Small Loans Facilities Act 1941 No. 22

Architects (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 25

Police Reserve Act 1941 No. 26

Navigation (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 27

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 29

Local Government (Electoral Provisions) Act 1941 No. 32
Supreme Court and Circuit Courts (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 37
Unauthorised Documents (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 38
Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 40
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 44

Public Works (Stormwater Channels Vesting) Act 1941 No. 50
Sydney Harbour Trust (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 58

Chantable Collections (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 59



16 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Government Insurance (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 62
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1941 No. 64
Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1942 No. |

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 11

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Pensions) Amendment Act 1942 No. 12
Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 20
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 24

Public Trustee (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 26

State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 27

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 28
Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 29

Transport (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 32

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 34
Scaffolding and Lifts (Amendment) Act 1942 No. 35

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Capital Indebtedness) Act 1943 No.
3

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 5
Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 8
Matrimonial Causes (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 9
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 15
Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 21
Transport (Administration) Act 1943 No. 23
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 25
Government Guarantees and Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 26
Conveyancing (Further Amendment) Act 1943 No. 29
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 31
Disorderly Houses (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 39
Government Insurance (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 40

Roman Catholic Church Communities’ Lands (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 41



17

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 42

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 43

Prevention of Cruelty to Animals (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 44
Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 45

Transport (Amendment) Act 1943 No. 46

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1944 No. !
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 2
Pure Food (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 5

Prickly-pear (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 6

Public Instruction (Blind and Infirm Children) Amendment Act 1944 No. 7
Noxious Trades (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 9

Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 1!

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 12

Government Railways (Rates) Amendment Act 1944 No. 13

Local Government (Electoral Provisions) Amendment Act 1944 No. 18
Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 20

Companies (Death Duties) Amendment Act 1944 No. 24

Auctioneers, Stock and Station and Real Estate Agents (Amendment) Act 1944 No.
25

Workers” Compensation (Bush Fire Fighters) Act 1944 No. 32

Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 34

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 36

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1944 No. 37
Police Offences (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 3

Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 4

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 5

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 12

Crown Lands, Returned Soldiers Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment)
Act 1945 No. 14



18 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 17

Local Government (Town and Country Planning) Amendment Act 1945 No. 21
Transport (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 22

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 23

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 28

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 29

Opticians (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 36

Hunter District Waler, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1945 No. 37
Dentists (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946 No. 2)

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946 No. 3)

Government Railways and Sydney Harbour Trust (Financial Provisions) Act 1945
(1946 No. 8)

Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946 No. 9)
Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946 No. 10)
Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946 No. 11)

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1945 (1946
No. 14)

Auctioneers, Stock and Station and Real Estate Agents (Amendment) Act 1946 No.
18

Compensation to Relatives (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 23
War Service Land Settlement (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 26
Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 27
Industrial Arbitration (Police) Amendment Act 1946 No. 28
Irrigation and Water (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 35
Hospital Benefits Agreement Act 1946 No. 37

Forestry (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 39

Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 41
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 47
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1946 No. 51

Damages (Infants and Persons of Unsound Mind) Amendment Act 1947 No. 1



19

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 4

Royal Agricultural Society (Amendment) Act 1947 No. §

Industrial Arbitration (Forty Hours Week) Amendment Act 1947 No. 6
Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 9

Soil Conservation (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 11

City and Suburban Electric Railways (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 13

Coal and Ot} Shale Mine Workers (Pensions) Amendment Act 1947 No. 14

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1947 No.
15

Co-operation (Further Amendment) Act 1947 No. 18

Police Regulation (Appeals) Amendment Act 1947 No. 19
Local Government (Electoral Provisions) Act 1947 No. 21
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 23

Housing (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 24

Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 25

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 27
Physiotherapists Registration (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 31
State Transport (Co-ordination) Amendment Act 1947 No. 32
Police Offences (Firearms) Amendment Act 1947 No. 34
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 37

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Pensions) Further Amendment Act 1947 No.
39

Jury (Amendment) Act 1947 No. 41

Roman Catholic Church Communities’ Lands (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 2
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 4

Workmen's Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1948 No. 5

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Pensions) Amendment Act 1948 No. 7
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 13

Crown Lands (Irrigation Areas Servicemen Settlement) Amendment Act 1948 No.
15



20 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 16

Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 17

Supreme Court and Circuit Courts (Prothonotary) Amendment Act 1948 No. 22
Transport (Officers Gratuities) Amendment Act 1948 No. 23

University and University Colleges {Amendment) Act 1948 No. 24

Friendly Societies Dispensaries Enabling (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 27

Public Accountants Registration (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 32

Scaffolding and Lifts (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 38

Racing (Amendment) Act 1948 No. 39

Landlord and Tenant (Further Amendment) Act 1948 No. 43

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1948 No.
48

Navigation (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 9

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 10
Housing (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 12

Main Roads (Federal Aid Roads and Works) Amendment Act 1949 No. 13
Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 14

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 16

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 18

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 21

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 23
Prices Regulation (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 24

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Pensions) Amendment Act 1949 No. 26
Public Instruction (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 29

Motor Trafhic (Fees) Amendment Act 1949 No. 35

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 37

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 41

Racing (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 42

Mental Institution Benefits Agreement Act 1949 No. 43



21

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS-—continued

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 45

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1949 No. 46

Anglican Church of Australia Trust Property (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 4
Roman Catholic Church Trust Property (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 5
Transport and Highways Act 1950 No. 10

Main Roads and Transport (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 13

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 18

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 19
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 25
Workmen's Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1950 No. 26

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1950 No.
27

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 29

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 31

Constitution Amendment (Legislative Assembly) Act 1950 No. 33

Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 35

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1950 No. 37
Industrial Arbitration (Basic Wage) Amendment Act 1950 No. 38
Moratorium (Amendment) Act 1950 No. 39

Public Accountants Registration (Amendment) Act 1951 No. |
Superannuation (Defence Service) Amendment Act 1951 No. 2

Dried Fruits (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 5

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 6

Racing (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 9

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 10

Coal Mining Industry Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 13
Forestry (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 14

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 15

University and University Colleges (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 29



22 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 31
State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 34
Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 39

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1951 No.
40

Valuation of Land (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 41
Matrimonial Causes (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 43

Police Offences (Age Limitation on the Use of Firearms) Amendment Act 1951 No.
44

Local Government (Land Acquisition) Amendment Act 1951 No. 46

Coal Industry (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 47

Government Railways (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1951 No. 48
Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1951 No. 49

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1951 No. 52
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 54

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 55

Motor Vehicles Taxation Management (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 57
Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 59

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1951 No. 61

Workmen’s Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1951 No. 62
Copyright (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 2

Height of Buildings (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 3

Veterinary Surgeons (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 4

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1952 No. §
Public Health (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 10

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 12

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 13

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 16
Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 17



23

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Bookmakers (Taxation) Amendment Act 1952 No. 18
State Tileworks (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 21

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 23

Royal Blind Society of New South Wales Act 1952 No. 25

Soil Conservation and Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1952
No. 27

Library (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 29
Potato Growers Licensing (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 34

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Further Amendment) Act 1952 No.
36

Transport (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 39

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 41

Water (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 42

Crown Lands (Special Leases) Amendment Act 1952 No. 44

Coal Mining Industry Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 49
Motor Traffic {Amendment) Act 1952 No. 50

University and University Colleges (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 51

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1952 No. 52
Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1952 No. 59

Oaths (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 4

Sale of Goods (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 8

Pure Food (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 9

Maritime Services (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 18

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 22

Cattle Slaughtering and Diseased Animals and Meat (Amendment) Act 1953 No.
25

Workers’ Compensation (Silicosis) Amendment Act 1953 No. 28
Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 31
Workmen's Compensation {(Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1953 No. 32
Compensation to Relatives (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 33



24 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Prevention of Cruelty to Animals (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 35
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1953 No. 42
Coal Mining Industry Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1954 No. |

Auctioneers, Stock and Station and Real Estate Agents (Amendment) Act 1954 No.
2

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 3

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 4

Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 5§

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 6

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 7

Navigation (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 8

War Service Land Settlement (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 11
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 17

Supreme Court, Industrial Arbitration and Workers’ Compensation (Amendment)
Act 1954 No. 18

Electricity Commission (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 19

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 20

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1954 No. 23
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 24

Fines and Penalties (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 31

Justices (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 32

Necropolis (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 33

Evidence (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 35

Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 38

Administration of Estates Act 1954 No. 40

Local Government and Other Authorities (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1954
No. 41

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 43
Noxious Insects (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 44
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1954 No. 46



25

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS-—continued

Nurses Registration (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 4

Opticians (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 7

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 15

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 16

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 17

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 18

Real Property (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 19

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 21

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 22

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 23

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Long Service Leave) Act 1955 No. 27
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 30

Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 31

Industrial Arbitration (Basic Wage) Amendment Act 1955 No. 34

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1955 No. 35

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1955 No. 39
Housing (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 42

Sydney Turf Club (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 44

Interest Reduction (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 45

Crown Lands Amendment (Homes Sites) Act 1955 No. 47

Local Government, Motor Traffic and Transport (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 49
Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 51

War Service Land Settlement and Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1955 No.
54

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1955 No. 55

Motor Trafhic and Transport (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 1

Transport (Division of Functions) Commissioner for Railways Act 1956 No. 2
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 6

Real Property (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 12



26 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 14

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 15

Motor Traffic and Transport (Further Amendment) Act 1956 No. 16
Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Act 1956 No. 17

The Presbyterian Church (New South Wales) Property Trust (Amendment) Act 1956
No. 20

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 23
Stamp Duties (Further Amendment) Act 1956 No. 25

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 28

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1956 No. 29

Electricity Commission (Balmain Electric Light Company. Purchase) Amendment
Act 1956 No. 30

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 32

Local Government and Cattie Slaughtering and Diseased Animals and Meat
(Amendment) Act 1956 No. 36

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Act 1956 No. 37
Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 39

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 40

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1956 No. 42

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 4

Electricity Development (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 7

Veterinary Surgeons (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 8

Coal Mining Industry Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 10
Height of Buildings (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 12

Auctioneers, Stock and Station, Real Estate and Business Agents (Amendment) Act
1957 No. 15

Cattle Slaughtering and Diseased Animals and Meat (Amendment) Act 1957 No.
17

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1957 No. 18
Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 20



27

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Act 1957 No. 21
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 23

Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 25

Pure Food (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 27

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 30

Workmen’s Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1957 No. 34
Bursary Endowment (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 36

Royal New South Wales Institution for Deaf and Blind Children Act 1957 No. 38
Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 40

Architects (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 41

Dried Fruits (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 42

New South Wales Government Engineering and Shipbuilding Undertaking
(Amendment) Act 1957 No. 45

Public Instruction (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 46

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 50

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 52

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 53

Crown Lands (Irrigation Area Resumption) Amendment Act 1957 No. 56
Fish River Water Supply Administration (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 57
Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 60

Justices (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 61

Land Tax Management (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 62

Main Roads and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 65

Motor Traffic and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1957 No. 67

Police Regulation (Superannuation and Appeals) Amendment Act 1958 No. 2
Fire Brigades and Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 4

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Act 1958 No. 5
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 7

Common Law Procedure and Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 10



28 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 12

Pure Food (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 14

Workers’ Compensation (Silicosis) Amendment Act 1958 No. 19
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 21

Matrimonial Causes (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 22

Justices (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 25

Crown Lands (Permissive Occupancies) Amendment Act 1958 No. 26
Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 28

Public Accountants Registration (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 31
Workers' Compensation (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 32

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 36
Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 37

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 40

Industrial Arbitration (Female Rates) Amendment Act 1958 No. 42
Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 46

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 47

The Baptist Union Incorporation (Amendment) Act 1958 No. 49
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 1

Local Government and Other Authorities (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1959
No. 2

Main Roads and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 3
Ministers of the Crown Act 1959 No. 4

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Act 1959 No. 5
Library (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 12

Physiotherapists Registration (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 19

Suitors’ Fund (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 20

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 29

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 30

Valuation of Land and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1959 No. 31



29

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1959 No. 33
Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1959 No. 34
Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 4

Roman Catholic Church Trust Property (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 6
Suitors’ Fund (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 8

Scaffolding and Lifts (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 9

Housing (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 12

Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 13

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 15

Factories and Shops and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 17
Nurses Registration (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 18

Public Service and Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 19

Coal Industry (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 22

Country Water Supplies Administration and State Brickworks (Amendment) Act
1960 No. 24

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 25
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 26
Public Health (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 27

Workers” Compensation {Amendment) Act 1960 No. 30
Land Tax Management (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 35

Sydney Harbour Bridge (Further Works) and Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1960
No. 37

Housing (Further Amendment) Act 1960 No. 47

Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 54

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 56

Police Regulation and Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1960 No. 57

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 2

Motor Trafic (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 4

Coal and O1l Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1961 No. 6



30 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Motor Spirit and Substitute Liquid Fuels (Repeal) Act 1961 No. 7
Local Government (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 11

Public Health (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 12

Grain Elevators (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 20

Industrial Arbitration (Further Amendment) Act 1961 No. 21
Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 23

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 24

Industrial Arbitration (Basic Wage) Amendment Act 1961 No. 29
Museum of Applied Arts and Sciences Act 1961 No. 30

Public Works (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 31

Co-operation (Rural Societies) Amendment Act 1961 No. 33
Radioactive Substances (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 36

Banks and Bank Holidays (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 41
Australian Jockey Club (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 52

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Further Amendment Act 1961
No. 53

Mining (Renewal of Leases) Amendment Act 1961 No. 59

Stock Diseases (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 64

Transport (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 65

Valuation of Land and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 66
War Service Land Settlement (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 68

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1961 No. 70

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 2

QOaths (Amendment) Act 1962 No. §

Argentine Ant Eradication Act 1962 No. 6

Sydney Harbour Bridge (Administration) Amendment Act 1962 No. 9
Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 12
Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 23

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1962 No. 25



31

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1962 No. 26
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 27 ’

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1962 No. 29
New South Wales State Cancer Council (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 32

Plant Diseases and Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 33

Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 35

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 36

Constitution (Amendment) Act 1962 No. 39

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 5

Sydney Opera House (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 6

Electricity Development (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 9

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 10

Royal Blind Society of New South Wales (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 12
Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 14

Housing (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 16

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 19

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 20

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 22

New South Wales Government Engineering and Shipbuilding Undertaking
(Amendment) Act 1963 No. 23

Book Purchasers’ Protection (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 26

Local Government (Regulation of Flats) Amendment Act 1963 No. 28
Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 29

Local Government (Boundaries Commission) Amendment Act 1963 No. 32
Local Government (Payment of Fees) Amendment Act 1963 No. 33
Optometrists (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 34

Venereal Diseases (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 37

Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 39

Land Tax (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 40



32 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 41
Motor Vehicles (Third Party Insurance) Amendment Act 1963 No. 43

Local Government and Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment)
Act 1963 No. 47

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 49

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Amendment Act 1963
No. 50

Racing (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 51
Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 55

Main Roads and Sydney Harbour Bridge (Administration) Amendment Act 1963
No. 56 '

Mining (Amendment) Act 1963 No. 57

Local Government, Liquor and Impounding (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 3
Dried Fruits (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 8

Irrigation and Water (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 11

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 13

Inclosed Lands Protection (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 14

Local Government and Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 15
Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 16

Law Reform (Married Persons) Act 1964 No. 17

Companies (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 20

Dentists (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 21

Electricity Development (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 22

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 23
Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 28

Transport Commissioners (Superannuation) Act 1964 No. 30

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 31

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 33

Housing Indemnities (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 34

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 35

51011-09218 — 86



33

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 37

Clean Air (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 39

Surveyors (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 46

Judges’ Pensions and Equity (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 52

Local Government (Building Regulation) Amendment Act 1964 No. 53
Nurses Registration (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 54

Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 58

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 59

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1964 No. 60
Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 61

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 62

Police Regulation (Assistant Commissioners) Amendment Act 1964 No. 63
Police Regulation (Women Police) Amendment Act 1964 No. 64

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 65

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1964 No. 67
Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1964 No. 68

Mental Health (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 69

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 70

Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1964 No. 73

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 2

Housing Indemnities (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 3

West Scholarships (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 7

Coal Industry (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 8

Auctioneers, Stock and Station, Real Estate and Business Agents (Amendment) Act
1965 No. 10

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 11
Supreme Court and Circuit Courts (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 12
Sydney Opera House (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 14

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 15



34 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 18
Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 19
Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1965 No. 20

Local Government and Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage
(Amendment) Act 1965 No. 21

Public Health (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 22

Bush Fires and Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 24

Companies (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 25

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 26

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 27

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 28
Police Offences (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 29

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 31

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1965 No. 36

Evidence (Amendment) Act 1966 No. |

Country Women’s Association of New South Wales Incorporation (Amendment) Act
1966 No. 3

Motor Traffic and Transport (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 4

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1966 No. 5§

Closer Settlement (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 8

Mine Subsidence Compensation (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 9

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1966 No. 12

Irrigation, Water, Crown Lands and Hunter Valley Flood Mitigation (Amendment)
Act 1966 No. 14

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 16

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Further Amendment Act 1966 No. 18
Adoption of Children (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 19

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 22

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1966 No. 23
Justices (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 24



35

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 25

Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 26

Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 27

Stock Diseases (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 32

Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 34

Roman Catholic Church Trust Property (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 38
Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 42

Prisons (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 43

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 44

Sydney Opera House (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 45

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 48

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1966 No. 49

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Further Amendment Act 1966 No.
50

Industrial Arbitration (Further Amendment) Act 1966 No. 51

Local Government (Control of Cemeteries) Amendment Act 1966 No. 52
Liquor (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 54

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 55

Factories, Shops and Industries and Pharmacy (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 58
Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 59

Motor Traffic, Metropolitan Traffic and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1966
No. 60

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1966 No. 62

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 6

Gaming and Betting and Liquor (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 7

Real Property (Conversion of Title) Amendment Act 1967 No. 9
City and Suburban Electric Railways (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 10
Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 12

Grain Elevators (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 15



36 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Nurses Registration (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 17

Police Offences, Vagrancy and Crimes (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 19
Radioactive Substances (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 20

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 23

State Development and Country Industries Assistance (Amendment) Act 1967 No.
24

Stock Diseases (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 25

Justices (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 28

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 29

Mine Subsidence Compensation (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 31
Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 38
Poisons {Amendment) Act 1967 No. 40

Returned Sailors, Soldiers and Airmen’s Imperial League of Australia (New South
Wales Branch) Incorporation Amendment Act 1967 No. 41

Dog (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 43
Height of Buildings (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 47

Medical Practitioners and New South Wales State Cancer Council (Amendment)
Act 1967 No. 49

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 50

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1967 No. 51
Public Works and Local Government (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 53

Petroleum (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 55

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 57

Swine Compensation (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 60

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 62

Friendly Societies (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 65

Petroleum (Further Amendment) Act 1967 No. 68

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Amendment Act 1967
No. 71

Sydney Opera House (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 73



37

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS-—continued

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 77

Permanent Building Societies (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 81
Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1967 No. §2
Government Railways (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1967 No. 85
Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 87

Necropolis (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 89

Prevention of Cruelty to Animals (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 91
Stamp Duties (Further Amendment) Act 1967 No. 92
Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 93

Survey Co-ordination (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 94

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1967 No. 99

Education (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 5

Local Government and Other Authorities (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1968
No. 6

Prisons (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 8

Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 10

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 12

Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 13

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1968 No. i4

Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1968 No. 19

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 21

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1968 No. 22
Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 23

Surveyors (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 28

Coal and 01l Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1968 No. 30
Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 31

Vagrancy, Disorderly Houses and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 32
Bursary Endowment (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 33

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 34



38 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Potato Growers Licensing (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 36

Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 38

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 39

Macquarie University (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 40

Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 41
Prisons (Further Amendment) Act 1968 No. 42

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 46

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 49

Hunter Valley Flood Mitigation and Hunter Valley Conservation Trust
(Amendment) Act 1968 No. 52

Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 54

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 55

Constitution (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 60

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 64

Textile Products Labelling (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 69

Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1968 No. 70

Evidence (Reproductions) Amendment Act 1969 No. 2

Judges’ Pensions and Equity (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 4

Trustee Companies (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 6

Sancta Sophia College Incorporation (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 10
Companies and Business Names (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 12
Surveyors (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 14

Transferred Officers Extended Leave (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 15
Architects (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 16

Coal Mining Industry Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 18
Forestry (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 20

Sydney Opera House (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 23

Sydney Opera House Trust (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 24
Veterinary Surgeons (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 25



39

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—-continued
REPEALS—continued

Broken Hill to South Austrahan Border Railway Agreement (Amendment) Act 1969
No. 26

Motor Vehicles and Government Railways (Miscellaneous Provisions) Amendment
Act 1969 No. 32

Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 36

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 39

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 43
Pharmacy (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 44

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 46

Door-to-Door Sales (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 50

Presbyterian Church (New South Wales) Property Trust (Amendment) Act 1969 No.
51

Optometrists and Optical Dispensers (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 57
Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 62

Prevention of Oil Pollution of Navigable Waters (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 63
War Service Land Settlement (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 65

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 67

Land Tax (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 69

Mine Subsidence Compensation (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 71
Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 72

Liquor (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 73

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 76

Library (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 77

Pure Food (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 79

Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1969 No. 81

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 1

Royal Blind Society of New South Wales (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 3
Australian Jockey Club (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 8

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 9
Legal Assistance and Suitors’ Fund (Amendment) Act 1970 No. [0



40 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 12
Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 13

Main Roads and Sydney Harbour Bridge (Administration) Amendment Act 1970
No. 15

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 16

Textile Products Labelling (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 17‘

Legal Practitioners and Oaths (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 20

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1970 No. 27
Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 36

Public Health (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 39

Interpretation (British Subject) Act 1970 No. 41

Local Government (Further Amendment) Act 1970 No. 42

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 44

Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 46

Friendly Societies Dispensaries Enabling (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 47
New South Wales State Cancer Council (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 48
Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1970 No. 51
Poisons (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 53

Macquarie University (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 56

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 57
University of New England (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 58

University of Newcastle (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 59

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 69

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 73

University of New South Wales (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 75

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 77

Consumer Protection (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 81

Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 83

Justices (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 85



41

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Library (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 86

Local Government (Rating of Coal Mines) Amendment Act 1970 No. 87
Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 89

Pharmacy (Amendment) Act 1970 No. 91

Costs in Criminal Cases (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 1

Crown Lands (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 2

Justices (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 3

Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1971 No. 5

Public Service and Other Statutory Bodies (Extended Leave) Amendment Act 1971
No. 6

Adoption of Children (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 13

Permanent Building Societies (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 15

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1971 No. 17
Water (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 21

Credit Union (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 23

Closer Settlement and Public Reserves Fund (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 24
Housing Indemnities (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 25

Public Trusts and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 29

Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 30

Coal Industry (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 33

Commercial Agents and Private Inquiry Agents (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 34
Crown Lands and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 35

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 39

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 44

Housing (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 45

New South Wales Institute of Psychiatry (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 46
Pharmacy (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 47

Library (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 49

Transport Employees Retirement Benefits (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 50



42 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 51
Commonwealth Places (Administration of Laws) Amendment Act 1971 No. 55
Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 60

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Payment of Rates) Amendment Act

1971 No. 64
Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Further Amendment Act 1971
No. 66

Industrial Arbitration (Further Amendment) Act 1971 No. 67
Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Payment of Rates) Amendment Act 1971 No. 68

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Payment of Rates) Amendment Act
1971 No. 69

Justices (Further Amendment) Act 1971 No. 70

Local Government (Payment of Rates) Amendment Act 1971 No. 71
Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1971 No. 73

Local Government (Appeals) Amendment Act 1971 No. 78
Electricity Commission (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 1

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 2
Maritime Services (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 3

Permanent Building Societies (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 8
Presbyterian Church of Australia (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 9
Roman Catholic Church Property (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 10
Auctioneers and Agents (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 12

Dentists (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 13

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 18

Physiotherapists Registration (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 21

Clean Air (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 22

Consumer Protection (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 25

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 27
Maintenance (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 31

Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 34



43

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1-—continued
REPEALS—continued

State Coal Mines (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 39

Trustee Companies (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 45
Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 47
Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 49
Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 52
Standard Time (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 54

Potato Growers Licensing (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 57
Stock Diseases (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 58

Clean Air (Further Amendment) Act 1972 No. 60

State Development and Country Industries Assistance and Government Savings
Bank (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 65

Judges® Pensions (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 69

Parliamentary Contributory Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 71
Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 74

Land Tax Management (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 75

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1972 No. 79

University and University Colleges (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 1
Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1973 No. 5
Archives (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 6

Evidence and Oaths (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 10

Main Roads (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 12

Valuation of Land (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 13

Venereal Diseases (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 14

Co-operation and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 15

Electricity Development {Amendment) Act 1973 No. 16

Companies (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 20

Motor Traffic and Transport (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 21

Electricity Commission (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1973 No. 24

Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 25



44 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | ~—-continued
REPEALS—continued

Grain Elevators (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 26

Police Regulation (Superannuation and Appeals) Amendment Act 1973 No. 27
Nurses Registration (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 30

Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 31
Sydney Opera House Trust (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 32

Housing and Public Works (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 40

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 44
Pay-roll Tax (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 48

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 50

Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1973 No. 52

Mine Subsidence Compensation and Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 55
Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Amendment Act 1973 No. 56

Prevention of Oil Pollution of Navigable Waters (Amendment} Act 1973 No. 59
Dairy Industry Authority (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 61

Farm Water Supplies (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 62

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 63

Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 64

Education (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 65

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 66

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 72

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1973 No. 73

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 74
Land Development Contribution Management (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 75
Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 77

Motor Vehicles (Taxation) and Motor Vehicles Taxation Management (Amendment)
Act 1973 No. 78

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 79
Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1973 No. 80
Electricity Development (Further Amendment) Act 1973 No. 82



45

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 84

Pipelines (Amendment) Act 1973 No. 86

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 4

Permanent Building Societies (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 5

Valuation of Land (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 9

Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 10

Government Railways and Transport (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 11
Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 12
Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 13
Argentine Ant Eradication (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 15

Library (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 24

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 29

Local Government (Safety of Dams) Amendment Act 1974 No. 30
Strata Titles (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 35

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 48

Pay-roll Tax (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 54

Motor Traffic and Transport (Further Amendment) Act 1974 No. 57
Maritime Services (Further Amendment) Act 1974 No. 58

Bread (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 59

Legal Practitioners and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 62
Pawnbrokers (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 63

Sydney Farm Produce Market Authority (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 66
Therapeutic Goods and Cosmetics (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 69
Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 75

Stock Diseases (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 84

Clean Waters (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 85

State Pollution Control Commission (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 88
Builders Licensing (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 91

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1974 No. 93



46 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Justices (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 94

Racing (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 96

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 97

Commonwealth Places (Administration of Laws) Amendment Act 1974 No. 99
Companies (Special Investigations) Amendment Act 1974 No. 100

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Further Amendment Act 1974 No. 101
Superannuation (Further Amendment) Act 1974 No. 104

Commercial Transactions (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1974 No. 105
Judges’ Pensions (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 106

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1974 No. 107

Local Government (Rating) Amendment Act 1974 No. 109

Housing (Amendment) Act 1975 No. §

Dried Fruits (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 7

Country Women’s Association of New South Wales Incorporation (Amendment) Act
1975 No. 12

Finances Adjustment (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 13

Government Railways, Transport and Electricity Commission (Amendment) Act
1975 No. 14

Public Health (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 16

Coal Mining (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 19

Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 20
Mining (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 23

Builders Licensing (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 30
Valuation of Land (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 43
Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 48
Bursary Endowment (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 52
Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 53
Education (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 55

Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 56



47

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Credit Union (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 59

Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 60

Hunter Valley Flood Mitigation (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 61

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1975 No. 66
Mine Subsidence Compensation (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 69

Main Roads and Other Acts (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 71

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 75

District Court (Further Amendment) Act 1975 No. 77

Fruit Cases (Repeal) Act 1975 No. 80

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 81

Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 82

Land Tax (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 83

Pay-roll Tax (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 87

Racing (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 88

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 90

Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Amendment Act 1975 No. 91

Weights and Measures (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 93

Governor’s Salary (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 94

Land Tax Management (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 97

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1975 No. 99

Local Government and Other Authorities (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1975
No. 101

Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 102

Commercial Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1975 No. 105
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1975 No. 108
First Offenders (Women) Repeal Act 1976 No. 5

Radioactive Substances (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 8

Western Lands (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 9

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 11



48 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Anglican Church of Australia Constitutions (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 12
Evidence (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 13

Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 14

Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 15

Rivers and Foreshores Improvement (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 17
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 20
Hawkers (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 24

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 26

Mining (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 27

Church of England Trust Property (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 37
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 38

Ombudsman (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 39

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Rating) Amendment Act 1976 No.
40

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Rating) Amendment Act [976 No.
41

Ministers of the Crown (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 42

Motor Vehicles Taxation Management (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 46
Acts Reprinting (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 47

Constitution (Ministers of the Crown) Amendment Act 1976 No. 48
Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 51

Local Government (Rating) Amendment Act 1976 No. 52

Mines Rescue (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 53

Miscellaneous Acts (Inspectors) Amendment Act 1976 No. 54
Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 56
Prices Regulation (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 65

Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1976 No. 70

Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 74

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 77



49

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 79

Racing Taxation (Betting Tax) Amendment Act 1976 No. 80

Soccer Football Pools (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 81

Bookmakers (Taxation) Amendment Act 1976 No. 82

Consumer Claims Tribunals (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 83

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 87

Police Regulation (Appeals) Amendment Act 1976 No. 88

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 89

Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Amendment Act 1976 No. 90

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1976 No. 91
Real Property (Amendment) Act 1976 No. 96

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1977 No. 2
Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 4

Poisons (Amendment) Act 1977 No. §

Transport (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 7

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 8

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1977 No. 9
Limitation (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 11

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 13

Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 14

Workers’ Compensation (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 15

Pipelines (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 17

Consumer Protection (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 23

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 24

Crown Lands (Special Areas) Amendment Act 1977 No. 26

Dog (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 27

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 29
Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 31

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 33



50 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Amendment Act 1977 No. 35

Venereal Diseases (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 36

Government Insurance (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 40

Long Service Leave (Metalliferous Mining Industry) Amenament Act 1977 No. 49
Transport Employees Retirement Benefits (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 51
Women'’s College (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 52

Indecent Articles and Classified Publications (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 53
Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 54

New South Wales Retirement Benefits (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 56
Gaming and Betting (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No. 60

Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 62

Prisons (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 64

Riverina Insurance Company Limited and Another Insurance Company
(Amendment) Act 1977 No. 65

Rural Workers Accommodation (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 66
Theatres and Public Halls (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No. 68
Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 70
Bread (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 73

Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 74

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No.
75

Growth Centres (Development Corporations) Amendment Act 1977 No. 77
Library (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 81

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 82

Pay-roll Tax (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 83

Returned Soldiers Settlement (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 85

State Development and Country Industries Assistance (Amendment) Act 1977 No.
86

Motor Traffic (Regulations) Amendment Act 1977 No. 88
Local Government (Noxious Plants) Amendment Act 1977 No. 89



51

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 91
Strata Titles (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 93

Valuers Registration (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 94

Wool, Hide and Skin Dealers (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 95
Government Railways (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1977 No. 99
Farmers’ Relief (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 101

Public Servant Housing Authority (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 102
Water (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 103

Dentists (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 105

Electricity Development (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 108

Poisons (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No. 110

Criminal Appeal (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 114

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No.
115

Teacher Housing Authority (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 117

Conveyancing (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 118

New South Wales State Conservatorium of Music (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 119
Supreme Court (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 120

Testator’s Family Maintenance and Guardianship of Infants (Amendment) Act 1977
No. 121

Wills, Probate and Administration (Amendment) Act 1977 No. 122

Country Industries (Pay-roll Tax Rebates) Amendment Act 1977 No. 128
Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act 1977 No. 130
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Further Amendment) Act 1977 No. 133
Law Reform (Joinder of Actions) Amendment Act 1978 No. 3

Law Reform (Nervous Shock) Amendment Act 1978 No. 4

Oaths {Amendment) Act 1978 No. §

The Baptist Union Incorporation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 6

District Court (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 8



52 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Gaming and Betting (Greyhound Racing Control Board) Amendment Act 1978 No.
9

Plant Diseases (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 10

Landlord and Tenant (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 11

Stock Foods and Medicines (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 12

Crown Lands (Maritime Services) Amendment Act 1978 No. 13

Electricity Commission (Financial Accommodation) Amendment Act 1978 No. 14
Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Maritime Services) Amendment Act 1978 No. 15
Maritime Services (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 16

Navigation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 18

Parliamentary Remuneration Tribunal (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 19

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 20

Port Rates (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 21

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 22

Crimes (Banking Transactions) Amendment Act 1978 No. 25

Evidence (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 26

Dormant Funds (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 32

Government Guarantees (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 33

Local Government (Footway Restaurants) Amendment Act 1978 No. 35
Local Government (Meat Industry) Amendment Act 1978 No. 36

Municipal Council of Sydney Electric Lighting (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 37
Noxious Trades (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 38

Real Property (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 39

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Meat Industry) Amendment Act 1978
No. 41

Constitution (Referendums) Amendment Act 1978 No. 45

Constitution (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 46

Local Government (Vehicles) Amendment Act 1978 No. 49

Local Government (University of New South Wales) Amendment Act 1978 No. 50



53

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Lotteries and Art Unions (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 51

Main Roads (Vehicles) Amendment Act 1978 No. 52

Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 55

Notice of Action and Other Privileges Abolition (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 56
Conveyancing (Receivers) Amendment Act 1978 No. 61

Justices (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 63

Local Government (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 64

Registered Clubs (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 68

Scaffolding and Lifts (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 69

Second-hand Dealers and Collectors (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 70

Dentists (Dental Board) Amendment Act 1978 No. 73

Dental Hospitals Union (Repeal) Act 1978 No. 74

Defamation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 79

Ombudsman (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 81

Parliamentary Papers (Supplementary Provisions) Amendment Act 1978 No. 82
Petroleum Products Subsidy (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 83

Police Regulation (Appeals) Amendment Act 1978 No. 85

Superannuation (Constitution) Amendment Act 1978 No. 86

Albury-Wodonga Development (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 94

City and Suburban Electric Railways (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 95
Educational Institutions (Stamp Duties Exemption) Amendment Act 1978 No. 97
Industrial Arbitration (Reinstatement Awards) Amendment Act 1978 No. 99
Real Property (Crown Grants) Amendment Act 1978 No. 100

Local Government (Forestry) Amendment Act 1978 No. 102

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Auctioneers and Agents) Amendment
Act 1978 No. 104

Limitation (Frustrated Contracts) Amendment Act 1978 No. 106
District Court (Frustrated Contracts) Amendment Act 1978 No. 107
Courts of Petty Sessions (Frustrated Contracts) Amendment Act 1978 No. 108



54 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1978 No. 109
Prickly-pear (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 112

Unauthorised Documents (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 113

Motor Traffic (Further Amendment) Act 1978 No. 114

Nurses Registration {Amendment) Act 1978 No. 116

Public Works (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 118

Irrigation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 120

Water (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 121

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 122

Motor Vehicles (Third Party Insurance) Amendment Act 1978 No. 123
Trotting Authority (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 124

Defamation (Trotting Authority) Amendment Act 1978 No. 125

Soil Conservation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 128

Water (Soil Conservation) Amendment Act 1978 No. 129

Gaming and Betting (Greyhound Racing Control Board) Further Amendment Act
1978 No. 131

Workers’” Compensation (Chiropractic) Amendment Act 1978 No. 133

Medical Practitioners (Chiropractic) Amendment Act 1978 No. 134
Physiotherapists Registration (Chiropractic) Amendment Act 1978 No. 135
Companies (Death Duties) Amendment Act 1978 No. 136

National Parks and Wildlife (Valuation of Land) Amendment Act 1978 No. 138
Police Regulation (Priority Lists and Appeals) Amendment Act 1978 No. 140
Workers’ Compensation (Sporting Injuries) Amendment Act 1978 No. 142
Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 143

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1978
No. 144

Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 146
Education (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 147
Meat Industry (Further Amendment) Act 1978 No. 150



55

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1-—continued
REPEALS—continued

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Government Insurance) Amendment Act
1978 No. 154

Prisons (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 155

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Corrective Services) Amendment Act
1978 No. 156

Dental Technicians Registration (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 157

Dentists (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 158

Workers’ Compensation (Dental Technicians) Amendment Act 1978 No. 159
Public Hospitals (United Dental Hospital of Sydney) Amendment Act 1978 No. 160
Fines and Forfeited Recognizances (Bail) Amendment Act 1978 No. 167
University and University Colleges (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 168
University of New England (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 169

University of New South Wales (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 170

University of Newcastle (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 171

Macquarie University (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 172

University of Wollongong (Amendment) Act 1978 No. 173

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1978 No. 174

Children (Equality of Status) Amendment Act 1979 No. 1

Registration of Births, Deaths and Marriages (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 2
Electricity Commission (Loans) Amendment Act 1979 No. 3

Maritime Services (Loans) Amendment Act 1979 No. 4

Government Railways (Constitution) Amendment Act 1979 No. §
Registration of Stock Brands (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 8

Parliamentary Remuneration Tribunal (Constitution) Amendment Act 1979 No. 12
Electricity Commission (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1979 No. 14
Permanent Building Societies (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 15

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment Act 1979 No. 17

Coal Mining (Dams Safety) Amendment Act 1979 No. 18

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Coal Mining) Amendment Act 1979
No. 19



56 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—-continued
REPEALS~—continued

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Coal Mining) Amendment Act 1979 No. 20
Traffic Authority (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 22

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Ethnic Affairs) Amendment Act 1979
No. 24

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Rates) Amendment Act 1979 No. 25
Real Property (Possessory Titles) Amendment Act 1979 No. 26

Limitation (Possessory Titles) Amendment Act 1979 No. 27

Stamp Duties (Possessory Titles) Amendment Act 1979 No. 28

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Coal Mining) Amendment Act 1979
No. 29

Local Government (Regulation of Flats} Amendment Act 1979 No. 30
Legal Practitioners (Law Foundation) Amendment Act 1979 No. 33

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Meat Industry) Amendment Act 1979
No. 37

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Constitution) Amendment Act 1979 No.
39

Evidence (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 40
Factories, Shops and Industries (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 42

Local Government (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers) Amendment Act 1979 No.
45

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers)
Amendment Act 1979 No. 46

Gas and Electricity (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers) Amendment Act 1979 No.
47

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers)
Amendment Act 1979 No. 48

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers) Amendment
Act 1979 No. 49

Liquefied Petroleum Gas (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers) Amendment Act 1979
No. 50

Builders Licensing (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers) Amendment Act 1979 No.
51



57

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers)
Amendment Act 1979 No. 52

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Elections) Amendment Act 1979 No.
54

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Elections) Amendment Act 1979
No. 55

Maritime Services (Elections) Amendment Act 1979 No. 56
Solicitor General (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 57

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Crown Advocate) Amendment Act 1979
No. 60

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1979 No. 61
Supreme Court (Public Assemblies) Amendment Act 1979 No. 65

District Court (Public Assemblies) Amendment Act 1979 No. 66

Prisons (Intoxicated Persons) Amendment Act 1979 No. 69

Justices (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 70

Crimes (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 72

Inclosed Lands Protection (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 73
Gaming and Betting (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 74
Courts of Petty Sessions (Civil Claims) Amendment Act 1979 No. 75

Police Offences (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 76

Landlord and Tenant (Summary Offences) Amendment Act 1979 No. 77
Consumer Protection (Legal Services Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. 79
Defamation (Legal Services Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. 80

Legal Practitioners (Legal Services Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. 81
Public Defenders (Legal Services Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. §2
Suitors’ Fund (Legal Services Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. 84

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Public Service) Amendment Act 1979
No. 94

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 95
Criminal Appeal (Crimes) Amendment Act 1979 No. 97



58 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE |—continued
REPEALS—continued

Bail (Crimes) Amendment Act 1979 No. 98

Securities Industry (Crimes) Amendment Act 1979 No. 100

Criminal Injuries Compensation (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 102

Business Names (Corporate Affairs Commission) Amendment Act 1979 No. 110

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Corporate Affairs Commission)
Amendment Act 1979 No. 111

Co-operation (Fisheries and Oyster Farms) Amendment Act 1979 No. 113

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Fish Marketing Authority) Amendment
Act 1979 No. 114

Workers' Compensation (Brucellosis) Amendment Act 1979 No. 117

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 120

Horticultural Stock and Nurseries (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 121

Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 122

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Water Rate) Amendment Act 1979 No. 128
Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 129

Energy Authority (Further Amendment) Act 1979 No. 134

Growth Centres (Development Corporations) Amendment Act 1979 No. 136

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Growth Centres) Amendment Act 1979
No. 137

Consumer Claims Tribunals (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 139
Noxious Insects (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 141

Strata Titles (Management) Amendment Act 1979 No. 142
Wild Dog Destruction (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 143
Rural Assistance (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 149

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 150

Registered Clubs (Liquor) Amendment Act 1979 No. 151
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 152
Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 153

Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 154

Ambulance Services (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 155



59

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Coal Industry (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 156
Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 157

Public Instruction (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No.
165

Sydney Harbour Trust (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 166
Housing (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No. 167

Government Railways (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979
No. 168

Public Works (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No. 169
Irrigation (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No. 170

Local Government (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No.
172

Stamp Duties (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment Act 1979 No. 173

Technical and Further Education (Real Property Computer Register) Amendment
Act 1979 No. 175

Justices (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 178
The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 180

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Builders Licensing Board) Amendment
Act 1979 No. 183

Trustee Companies (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 186

Wills, Probate and Administration (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 187
Public Trustee (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 188

Trustee (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 189

Superannuation (Public Service Superannuation Funds) Amendment Act 1979 No.
191

Bail (Community Service Orders) Amendment Act 1979 No. 193

Community Service Orders (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 194

Government Railways (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1979 No. 198

Western Lands (Leases and Productivity Schemes) Amendment Act 1979 No. 201
Heritage (Amendment) Act 1979 No. 206

Stamp Duties (Dairy Industry Marketing Authority) Amendment Act 1979 No. 209



60 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS-—continued

Statutory and Otber Offices Remuneration (Dairy Industry Marketing Authority)
Amendment Act 1979 No. 210

Intoxicated Persons (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 1

Warkworth Flood Mitigation and Water Conservation (Repeal) Act 1980 No. 3
Dairy Industry Marketing Authority (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 9

Pastures Protection (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 10

Soil Conservation (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 11

Constitution (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 13

Parliamentary Contributory Superannuation (Constitution) Amendment Act 1980
No. 14

Public Works (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 15

District Court (Contracts Review) Amendment Act 1980 No. 17
Parliamentary Contributory Superannuation (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 18
Waste Disposal (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 21

State Emergency Services and Civil Defence (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 22
Registered Clubs (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 25

Gaming and Betting (Registered Clubs) Amendment Act 1980 No. 26

Fire Brigades (Coroners) Amendment Act 1980 No. 30

Jury (Coroners) Amendment Act 1980 No. 31

Physiotherapists Registration (Coroners) Amendment Act 1980 No. 33
Prisons (Coroners) Amendment Act 1980 No. 34

Registration of Births, Deaths and Marriages (Coroners) Amendment Act [980 No.
35

Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 36

Co-operation (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 37

Police Regulation (Priority Lists) Amendment Act 1980 No. 40
Industrial Arbitration (Appeal Tribunal) Amendment Act 1980 No. 42
Judges’ Pensions (Appeal Tribunal) Amendment Act 1980 No. 44
Supreme Court (Appeal Tribunal) Amendment Act 1980 No. 46



61

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1| —continued
REPEALS—continued

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Appeal Tribunal) Amendment Act 1980
No. 47

Police Regulation (Allegations of Misconduct) Appeal Tribunal (Amendment) Act
1980 No. 48

Public Service (Appeal Tribunal) Amendment Act 1980 No. 49

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1980
No. 51

Crimes (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 53

Government Railways (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1980 No. 54
Industrial Arbitration (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 55

Hunter Valley Conservation Trust (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 56

New South Wales Institute of Psychiatry (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 58
Public Transport Commission (Loans) Amendment Act 1980 No. 59

Land Commission (Temporary Financial Accommodation) Amendment Act 1980
No. 60

Frustrated Contracts (Petty Sessions) Amendment Act 1980 No. 62
Anti-Discrimination (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 67
Defamation (Anti-Discrimination) Amendment Act 1980 No. 68

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Anti-Discrimination) Amendment Act
1980 No. 69

Anti-Discrimination (Education Commission) Amendment Act 1980 No. 70

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Motor Vehicle Repairs) Amendment Act
1980 No. 72

Motor Dealers (Motor Vehicle Repairs) Amendment Act 1980 No. 73
Municipal Council of Sydney Electric Lighting (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 75
Public Health (Local Government) Amendment Act 1980 No. 76

Land and Environment Court (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 77

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Drug and Alcohol Authority)
Amendment Act 1980 No. 83

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1980 No. 84
Prisons (Amendment and Validation) Act 1980 No. 88



62 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Public Hospitals (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 89

Industrial Arbitration (Oil Industry) Amendment Act 1980 No. 91
Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 93

Education Commission (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 99
University of Newcastle (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 100
Macquarie University (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 101

University of New England (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 102

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Transport Authorities) Amendment Act
1980 No. 107

Potato Growers Licensing (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 112

Police Regulation (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1980 No. 115
Theatres and Public Halls (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 116

Water (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 122

Land Commission (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 124

Local Government (Traffic Regulation) Amendment Act 1980 No. 125
Parliamentary Remuneration Tribunal (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 127

Theatres and Public Halls (Professional Boxing Control) Amendment Act 1980 No.
130

Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 131

Traffic Authority (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 133

Government Railways (Further Amendment) Act 1980 No. 138
Transport (Further Amendment) Act 1980 No. 139

Transport Authorities (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 140

Air Transport (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 148

Transport (Air Licensing Advisory Committee) Amendment Act 1980 No. 149
Land Sales (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 152

Motor Traffic (Alcohol Related Offences) Amendment Act 1980 No. 155
State Transport (Co-ordination) Amendment Act 1980 No. 156

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 158



63

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Local Government (Motor Trafhic) Amendment Act 1980 No. 159
Maritime Services (Motor Traffic) Amendment Act 1980 No. 160
Stamp Duties (Further Amendment) Act 1980 No. 161
Companies (Death Duties) Amendment Act 1980 No. 162

Metropolitan Water, Sewerage, and Drainage (Land Valuation) Amendment Act
1980 No. 165

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 167
Strata Titles (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 168

Valuation of Land (Water Boards) Amendment Act 1980 No. 169

Acts Reprinting (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 170

Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 171

Stock Diseases (Further Amendment) Act 1980 No. 172

Plant Diseases (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 173

Swine Compensation (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 174

Superannuation (Grain Handling) Amendment Act 1980 No. 177

Statutory and Other Ofhices Remuneration (Grain Handling) Amendment Act 1980
No. 179

Public Service (Grain Handling) Amendment Act 1980 No. 180

Government and Related Employees Appeal Tribunal (Grain Handling) Amendment
Act 1980 No. 182

Industrial Arbitration (Further Amendment) Act 1980 No. 183

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 184

Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1980 No. 185

Strata Titles (Auctioneers and Agents) Amendment Act 1980 No. 190
Crown Lands (Land Titles) Amendment Act 1980 No. 194

Government Guarantees (Co-operation) Amendment Act 1981 No. 6
Permanent Building Societies (Co-operation) Amendment Act 1981 No. 8
Swine Compensation (Swine Branding) Amendment Act 1981 No. 11
Dog (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 13

Local Government (Dog) Amendment Act 1981 No. 14



64 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Defamation (Anti-Discrimination) Amendment Act 1981 No. 16

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Anti-Discrimination) Amendment Act
1981 No. 17

Prisons (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 19

Motor Vehicles (Third Party Insurance) Amendment Act 1981 No. 21
Transport (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 22

Sydney Cricket and Sports Ground (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 23

Police Association Employees (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1981 No. 25
Totalizator (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 26

Foreign Judgments (Reciprocal Enforcement) Amendment Act 1981 No. 27
Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 28
Growth Centres (Development Corporations) Amendment Act 1981 No. 31
Police Regulation (Amendment and Validation) Act 1981 No. 33

Police Regulation (Retirement) Amendment Act 1981 No. 35

Crown Lands (Land Aggregation Tax) Amendment Act 1981 No. 39

Returned Soldiers Settlement (Land Aggregation Tax) Amendment Act 1981 No.
41

Poultry Processing (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 44

Gaming and Betting (Greyhound Racing Control Board) Amendment Act 1981 No.
46

Totalizator (Racecourse Development Fund) Amendment Act 1981 No. 47
Trotting Authority (Totalizator) Amendment Act 1981 No. 48

Water (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 49

Real Property (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 59

Crimes (Securities Industry) Amendment Act 1981 No. 65

Registered Clubs (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 69

Banana Industry (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 72

Workmen’s Compensation (Broken Hill) Amendment Act 1981 No. 75
Colleges of Advanced Education (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 87

51011-09218--87



65

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (State Bank) Amendment Act 1981 No.
91

Motor Traffic (Clean Air) Amendment Act 1981 No. 93

Clean Waters (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 94

Constitution (Referendums) Amendment Act 1981 No. 97

Election Funding (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 98

State Bank (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 101

Constitution (Legislative Assembly) Amendment Act 1981 No. 102
Constitution (Disclosures by Members) Amendment Act 1981 No. 103
Wills, Probate and Administration (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 106

Local Government (Parking Advisory Committees) Amendment Act 1981 No. 108
Funeral Funds (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 111

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 113

Maritime Services (Contributions) Amendment Act 1981 No. 115
Valuation of Land (Rating and Valuation) Amendment Act 1981 No. 118
Police Regulation (Deputy Commissioners) Amendment Act 1981 No. 120
Electricity Commission (Amendment) Act 1981 No. 128

Standard Time (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 1

Rivers and Foreshores Improvement (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 2

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1982 No. §

Public Roads (Delegations) Amendment Act 1982 No. 8

Commons Regulation (Delegations) Amendment Act 1982 No. 9
Prickly-pear (Delegations) Amendment Act 1982 No. 10

Western Lands (Delegations) Amendment Act 1982 No. 11

Mine Subsidence Compensation (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 12

Transport (Road Transport and Traffic Fund) Amendment Act 1982 No. 15
State Transport (Co-ordination) Amendment Act 1982 No. 16

Transport Authorities (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 19

Government Railways (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 20



66
Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Transport (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 21

Electricity Commission (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1982 No. 28

Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 29
Permanent Building Societies (Trust Investments) Amendment Act 1982 No. 34
Trustee (Investment Powers) Amendment Act 1982 No. 35

New South Wales State Cancer Council (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 36

Dried Fruits (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 39

Stamp Duties (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 43

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Amendment Act 1982 No. 45
Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 46

Parliamentary Electorates and Elections (Legislative Assembly) Amendment Act
1982 No. 47

Election Funding (Legislative Assembly) Amendment Act 1982 No. 48
Registered Clubs (Registration Fees) Amendment Act 1982 No. 50
Dangerous Goods (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 52

Liquefied Petroleum Gas (Dangerous Goods) Amendment Act 1982 No. 53
Motor Vehicle Repairs (Dangerous Goods) Amendment Act 1982 No. 54

Plumbers, Gasfitters and Drainers (Dangerous Goods) Amendment Act 1982 No.
55

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Government Insurance Office)
Amendment Act 1982 No. 57

Loan Fund Companies (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 58
Trustee Companies (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 61
Pay-roll Tax (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 62

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Electricity Commission) Amendment
Act 1982 No. 64

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Energy Authority) Amendment Act 1982
No. 66

Coal Mining (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 68

Fisheries and Oyster Farms (Commonwealth-State Arrangements) Amendment Act
1982 No. 71



67

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE l—continued
REPEALS—continued

Energy Authority (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 73

Churches of Christ in New South Wales Incorporation (Amendment) Act 1982 No.
100

Coal and Oil Shale Mine Workers (Superannuation) Further Amendment Act 1982
No. 102

Housing (Joint Ventures) Amendment Act 1982 No. 105

Transport (Road Transport and Traffic Fund) Further Amendment Act 1982 No.107
Soccer Football Pools (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 108

Horse-breeding (Repeal) Act 1982 No. 109

Lotto (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 110

Local Government (Elections) Amendment Act 1982 No. 113

Grain Handling (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 114

Education Commission (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 118

Public Service (Housing Commission) Amendment Act 1982 No. 119

Parliamentary Remuneration Tribunal (Public Accounts Committee) Amendment
Act 1982 No. 126

Futures Markets (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 128

Motor Vehicles (Taxation) Further Amendment Act 1982 No. 129
Stamp Duties (Further Amendment) Act 1982 No. 134

Public Service (Department of Health) Amendment Act 1982 No. 136

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration (Department of Health) Amendment Act
1982 No. 137

South-west Tablelands Water Supply Administration (Amendment) Act 1982 No.
140

Fish River Water Supply Administration (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 141
Anti-Discrimination (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 142

New South Wales Film Corporation (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 145
Dog (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 146

Local Government (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 150
Motor Traffic (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 151



68 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1—continued
REPEALS—continued

Crown Lands (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 152

Forestry (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 153

Main Roads (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 154

National Parks and Wildlife (Abandoned Vehicles) Amendment Act 1982 No. 156

Testator’s Family Maintenance and Guardianship of Infants (Family Provision)
Amendment Act 1982 No. 161

Wills, Probate and Administration (Family Provision) Amendment Act 1982 No.
162

Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Amendment Act 1982 No. 169

Soccer Football Pools (Sport and Recreation Fund) Amendment Act 1982 No. 171
Industrial Arbitration (Unclaimed Money) Amendment Act 1982 No. 175
Electricity Development (Amendment) Act 1982 (1983 No. 1)

Police Regulation (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 5

Broken Hill Water and Sewerage (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 6

Gas and Electricity (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 7

Public Service (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 8

Prostitution (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 12

New South Wales Retirement Benefits (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 24
Trustee (Powers of Attorney) Amendment Act 1983 No. 28

Motor Traffic (Local Government) Amendment Act 1983 No. 34

Law Reform (Miscellaneous Provisions) Amendment Act 1983 No. 39
Transport (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 40

Medical Practitioners (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 41

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 47

Meat Industry (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 49

Stock Diseases (Meat Inspection) Amendment Act 1983 No. 50

Stock (Chemical Residues) Meat Inspection (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 51
Swine Compensation (Meat Inspection) Amendment Act 1983 No. 52

Cattle Compensation (Meat Inspection) Amendment Act 1983 No. 53



69

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE | —continued
REPEALS—continued

Cumberland Oval (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 56
Fire Brigades (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 59
National Parks and Wildlife (Fire Brigades) Amendment Act 1983 No. 60

Industrial Arbitration (Complementary Industrial Relations System) Amendment
Act 1983 No. 61

Transport Employees Retirement Benefits (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 64
Registered Clubs (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 67

Gaming and Betting (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 69

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act 1983 No. 70
Stamp Duties (Financial Institutions Duty) Amendment Act 1983 No. 72
Public Authorities (Financial Accommodation) Amendment Act 1983 No. 76
Local Government (Revenue Sharing) Amendment Act 1983 No. 87

Annual Holidays (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 91

Long Service Leave (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 99

Long Service Leave (Metalliferous Mining Industry) Amendment Act 1983 No. 100
Transport (Motor Traffic) Amendment Act 1983 No. 101

New South Wales Retirement Benefits (Public Authorities Superannuation Board)
Amendment Act 1983 No. 105

Transport Employees Retirement Benefits (Public Authorities Superannuation
Board) Amendment Act 1983 No. 106

Gaming and Betting (Penalties) Amendment Act 1983 No. 121

Observatory Park Weather Bureau Site (Repeal) Act 1983 No. 126
Ombudsman (Community Justice Centres) Amendment Act 1983 No. 129
Bush Fires (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 149

Petroleum (Coal Mining) Amendment Act 1983 No. 155

Factories, Shops and Industries (Retail Trade) Amendment Act 1983 No. 160
Industrial Arbitration (Retail Trade) Amendment Act 1983 No. 161

Tissue Grafting and Processing (Repeal) Act 1983 No. 166

Medical Practitioners (Emergency Medical Treatment) Amendment Act 1983 No.
167



70 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 1——continued
REPEALS—continued

Land Tax (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 172

Offences in Public Places (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 187

Inclosed Lands Protection (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 188

Ombudsman (Amendment) Act 1983 No. 189

Ombudsman (Police Regulation) Amendment Act 1983 No. 193

Local Government (Rating and Valuation) Amendment Act 1983 No. 206
Mines Inspection (Amendment) Act 1984 No. 8

University of Newcastle (Amendment) Act 1984 No. 14

Election Funding (Amendment) Act 1984 No. 35

Police Regulation (Allegations of Misconduct) (Commissioner of Public Complaints)
Amendment Act 1984 No. 77

SCHEDULE 2
(Sec. 5)
AMENDMENT TO THE ART GALLERY OF NEW SOUTH WALES
ACT 1980

Section 7 (2)—

Omit “‘the southern hemisphere”, insert instead “Asian or Pacific
countries whose cultural traditions are of special interest to
Australia”.

SCHEDULE 3
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE CONVEYANCING ACT 1919

(1) Section 2—

Omit the section.



71

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 3—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE CONVEYANCING ACT 1919—continued

(2) Part XIIla—
After Part XIII, insert:

PART XIIla
ALIENS

Capacity of aliens to hold and deal with property and interests in
property

146A. Notwithstanding the provisions of any Act or law—

(a) a person is not prevented from taking, acquiring, holding
or disposing of any property by reason only that the person
1s not a natural born British subject; and

(b) title to property may be derived through, from, or in
succession to such a person, in all respects as through, from
or in succession to a natural born British subject.

SCHEDULE 4
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE DE FACTO RELATIONSHIPS ACT 1984

(1) Section 4—

Omit the section.

(2) Section 35 (3)—

Omit “subsection (2) (b)”, insert instead “‘subsection (2) (c)”.

(3) Section 38 (1) §1)—
After section 38 (1) (j), insert:

(J1) make an order in the absence of a party;



72 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 4-—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE DE FACTO RELATIONSHIPS ACT 1984—
continued

(4) Section 40 (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead:

(1) In the case of urgency, a court may make or grant, as the
case may be, any one or more of the following:

(a) an ex parte order pursuant to section 28;

(b) an ex parte order or ex parte injunction for either or both
of the purposes specified in section 38 (1) (h);

(c) an ex parte injunction for any of the purposes specified in
section 53.

(5) Section 58—
Omit “Part V", insert instead “Parts V and VII™.

SCHEDULE 5
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE DORMANT FUNDS ACT 1942

Sections 12, 13—

Omit “two hundred dollars” wherever occurring, insert instead
“$2,000”.

SCHEDULE 6
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE FAMILY PROVISION ACT 1982



73

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

(1) Section 20 (2)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead:

(2) The Court shall not disregard the interests of an eligible
person unless—

(a) notice of the application before it and of the Court’s power
to disregard those interests has been served upon the
eligible person in the manner and form prescribed by rules
of court; or

(b) the Court has determined that service of such a notice on
that person is unnecessary, unreasonable or impracticable.

(2) Section 20 (3)—

Omit the subsection.

SCHEDULE 7
(Sec. 5)
AMENDMENT TO THE FILM AND VIDEO TAPE CLASSIFICATION
ACT 1984
Section 3 (1), definition of “minor”—
Omit ““, but does not include a married person”.
SCHEDULE 8
(Sec. 5)
AMENDMENTS TO THE FIREARMS AND DANGEROUS WEAPONS
ACT 1973

(1) (a) Section 6, definition of “firearms dealer”—

Omit “parts” wherever occurring, insert instead “‘spare barrels
or parts”.



74 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 8—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE FIREARMS AND DANGEROUS WEAPONS
ACT 1973—continued

(b) Section 6, definition of “spare barrel”—

Omit “pistol” wherever occurring, insert instead “‘firearm”.

(2) Sections 22 (8), 23B (8), 39a (1), 40a (1), 724a (4) (as inserted by Act
No. 51, 1985)—

hl

After “ ‘firearm’” wherever occurring, insert “includes a spare
barrel for a firearm other than a pistol but”.

(3) Section 31—

After “spare barrel”, insert “for a pistol”.

(4) (a) Section 39 (1) (¢) (1)—
After “barrels”, insert “for pistols”.
(b) Section 39 (1) (c) (i1)—

After “pistols,”, insert ‘“‘or spare barrels for firearms other than
pistols,”.

(5) (a) Section 398 (1) (as inserted by Act No. 51, 1985)—

After “subsection”, insert “and to a spare barrel for a firearm
other than a pistol”.

(b) Section 398 (2) (as inserted by Act No. 51, 1985)—
After “firearm” wherever occurring, insert ‘““or spare barrel”.
(6) Section 40 (1)—

After * ‘firearm’ >, insert “includes a spare barrel for a firearm
other than a pistol but”.

(7) (a) Section 42 (1)—

After “barrel” where firstly occurring, insert “for a pistol”.



75

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 8—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE FIREARMS AND DANGEROUS WEAPONS
ACT 1973—continued

(b) Section 42 (2) and (3) (as inserted by Act No. 51, 1985)—

After “gun,” wherever occurring, insert ‘““or a spare barrel for a
firearm other than a pistol,”.

(c) Section 42 (3) (a), (b) (as inserted by Act No. 51, 1985)—
After “the fircarm” wherever occurring, insert “or spare barrel”.
(d) Section 42 (3) (as inserted by Act No. 51, 1985)—

Omit “the firearm,”, insert instead “the firearm or spare barrel,”.

(8) Section 71 (6)—
After section 71 (5), insert:

(6) In this section, “firearm” includes a spare barrel for a
firearm other than a pistol.

SCHEDULE 9
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE FISHERIES AND OYSTER FARMS ACT 1935

(1) Section 3—

Omit the section.

(2) Sections 4H, 4K, 4L, 14, 20a, 224, 24, 244, 24c, 25, 258, 90, 94, 104,
107, 111 (2), 119, 120 (2) (d)—

Omit “license” wherever occurring, insert instead “‘licence”.

(3) Sections 4H (3), (4), 4K (2), 24a (5), 25 (7), 25a (1) (a), 258 (5), 25C
(2)—

Omit “licenses” wherever occurring, insert instead “‘licences”.



76

Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 9—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE FISHERIES AND OYSTER FARMS ACT

1935—continued

(4) Part I1a, heading—

Omit “AMATEUR FISHERMEN’S”, insert instead “N.S.W.

RECREATIONAL FISHING.

(5) Section 17¢ (1)—

Omit “Amateur Fishermen’s”, insert
Recreational Fishing”.

(6) Headings before sections 244, 104, 119—
Omit the headings.

instead “N.S.W.

(7) Section 254 (1) (a) (as amended by Act No. 112, 1979)—

Omait “license”, insert instead ‘‘licence”.

(8) Section 122—

After section 121, insert:

Savings, transitional and other provisions
122. Schedule C has effect.

(9) Schedule C—
After Schedule B, insert:

SCHEDULE C

(Sec. 122)

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS

Change of name of Amateur Fishermen’s Advisory Council

1. (1) The N.S.W. Recreational Fishing Advisory Council is
a continuation of, and the same body as, the Amateur

Fishermen’s Advisory Council.



77

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 9—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE FISHERIES AND OYSTER FARMS ACT
1935—continued

(2) A reference in any other Act or in any instrument or
document of any kind to the Amateur Fishermen’s Advisory
Council shall be read as a reference to the N.S.W. Recreational
Fishing Advisory Council.

SCHEDULE 10
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916
(1) Section 7 (3)—

Omit “let on lease,”.

(2) (a) Section 11 (1) (m) (iv)—

Omit “under this Act”, insert instead “conferred or imposed by
or under this or any other Act™.

(b) Section 11 (1) (m1) (i)—

After “is formed”, insert “for the purpose of carrying on the
business of forestry or”.

(c) Section 11 (1) (n)—

Omit “under this section”, insert instead “by or under this Act”.



78 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 10—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916—continued

(3) Section 13 (2)-(2D)—
Omit section 13 (2), insert instead:

(2) There shall be paid into the Forestry Commission Account
at the Treasury in the year commencing 1 July 1986 and in each
succeeding year out of the Consolidated Fund an amount equal
to one-half of the gross amount that, after excluding any amounts
paid to a special deposits account established under section 12
(2), is received by the commission from or in respect of—

(a) royalties or amounts recovered by or paid to it under
section 30H, 301, 43, 46A or 48;

(b) licences, forest leases and permits under this Act;
(c) the sale of timber and products; and

(d) the exercise by the commission of any power, privilege or
authority conferred on the commission by section 11c (2)
in respect of a patented invention.

(2A) The amount paid into the Forestry Commission Account
under subsection (2) shall be set apart for—

(a) afforestation, reafforestation and survey and improvement
of State forests and timber reserves;

(b) the purposes of section 11 (3);

(c) roads;

(d) the resumption of land under this Act,
and for purposes incidental thereto.

(2B) The sum set apart in any year may during that and the
next succeeding year, but at no other time, be expended under
the control of the commission for the purposes specified in
subsection (2A) without any authority other than this Act.

(2¢) A return of any money expended in accordance with
subsection (2B) in any year shall as soon as possible after the
commencement of the next succeeding year be laid before both
Houses of Parliament.



79

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 10—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916—continued

(2D) The amounts required by subsection (2) to be paid into
the Forestry Commission Account at the Treasury are hereby
appropriated out of the Consolidated Fund.

(4) (a) Section 27 (1)—
Omit “five hundred dollars”, insert instead “$1,000”.
(b) Section 27 (1)—
Omit ““three”, insert instead 6.
(c) Section 27 (1)—
Omit “five dollars”, insert instead “$10”.
(d) Section 27 (2)—

After “obtaining a”, insert “timber licence, products licence or”.

(5) (a) Section 30H (1)—

Omit ““takes or destroys”, insert instead ‘‘takes, destroys or
damages”.

(b) Section 30H (1)—
Omit “taking or destroying”, insert instead ‘‘taking, destroying
or damaging”.
(6) (a) Section 32 (2)—
After “occupy”, insert “‘or use”.
(b) Section 32 (4)—

After “occupation”, insert ““or use”.

(7) (a) Section 32D (1) (a), (b) (i)—

After “section 32c (2) (a) or (b)” wherever occurring, insert “‘and
any bird or animal”.

(b) Section 32D (2)—

After “or (b)”, insert “and any bird or animal”.



80 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 10—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916—continued

(c) Section 32D (2)—

After “placed in”, insert “or taken, killed, hunted, shot, poisoned,
netted, snared, speared, captured, lured or injured in”.

(d) Section 32D (3)—

After “section 32c (2) (a) or (b)”, insert ““or a bird or an animal”.

(8) (a) Section 32—
After “section 32c (2) (a) or (b)” insert “or a bird or an animal”.
(b) Section 32E (a), (b), (c)—

After “article or thing” wherever occurring, insert “or bird or
animal”,

(c) Section 32E (b)—

Omit “on or after”, insert instead “at any time”.

(9) Section 41 (1) (c)—

Omit “licence”, insert instead ‘“‘lease, licence”.

(10) Section 43 (2p) (b)—

Omit “on or after”, insert instead “at any time”.



81

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 10—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE FORESTRY ACT 1916—continued

(11) Second Schedule—
Omit the Schedule, insert instead:

SECOND SCHEDULE
(Sec. 301)

Conditional Lease, Conditional Purchase Lease, Special
Conditional Purchase Lease, Settlement Lease, Crown-lease,
Residential Lease, Special Lease, Western Lands Lease, Special
Western Lands Lease, Prickly-pear Lease and any such lease held
as an additional lease, whether or not the land the subject of any
such lease has been brought under the provisions of the Real
Property Act 1900.

SCHEDULE 11
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERPRETATION ACT 1897

(1) (a) Section 21a (1), definition of “Commonwealth Act”—
Omit the definition.
(b) Section 21A (1), definition of “relevant Commonwealth law”—
After the definition of “law of New South Wales”, insert:

“relevant Commonwealth law’ means the Australian
Citizenship Act 1948 of the Commonwealth as amended
and in force immediately before the commencement of
Schedule 11 to the Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions)
Act 1985 and the regulations in force immediately before
that commencement under the Australian Citizenship Act
1948 of the Commonwealth as so amended and in force.

(c) Section 21a (2) (a), (3) (a)—

Omit “, under the Commonwealth Act,” wherever occurring,
insert instead ‘“would, if the relevant Commonwealth law had
continued in force, be a person who™.



82 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 11—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERPRETATION ACT 1897—continued

(d) Section 21a (2) (b), (3) (b)—

After “who” wherever occurring, insert “would, if the relevant
Commonwealth law had continued in force, be a person who™.

(2) Section 25B—

After section 254, insert:

References to changed short titles and citations in Acts or
statutory instruments

258. Where the short title or citation of an Act or an
instrument made under an Act is changed (whether before or
after the commencement of this section) a reference to the short
title or citation in any other Act, instrument made under an Act
or in a document of any kind shall be read as a reference to the
short title or citation as changed.

SCHEDULE 12
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE JURY ACT 1977
Section 4 (3)—
After section 4 (2), insert:

(3) A reference in this Act to an electoral district or a
subdivision includes a reference to a part of an electoral district
or a part of a subdivision, as the case may be.




83

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 13
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE LANDLORD AND TENANT (RENTAL
BONDS) ACT 1977

(1) Section 20 (4) (a)—

Omit “or”.

(2) Section 20 (4) (b), (¢)—
At the end of section 20 (4) (b), insert:
;or

(c) other activities approved by the Minister that are relevant
to matters associated with the relationship of landlord and
tenant,

SCHEDULE 14
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1919

(1) (a) Section 50 (1) (a) (ii)—
Omit the subparagraph, insert instead:

(i) a person (other than an Australian citizen) who would, if
the relevant Commonwealth law had continued in force,
be a person who has the status of a British subject and who
was, immediately before 26 January 1984, enrolled as an
elector for the Legislative Assembly or enrolled in any
other State or any Territory of the Commonwealth as an
elector for the House of Representatives; and

(b) Section 50 (3)—
After section 50 (2), insert:

(3) In this section—



84 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 14—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1919—
continued

“relevant Commonwealth law’ means the Australian
Citizenship Act 1948 of the Commonwealth as amended
and in force immediately before the commencement of
Schedule 14 to the Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions)
Act 1985 and the regulations in force immediately before
that commencement under the Australian Citizenship Act
1948 of the Commonwealth as so amended and in force.

(2) Section 269a (3A)—
After section 269A (3), insert:

(3a) The reference in subsection (3) (d) to prescribed cases or
classes of cases and prescribed conditions or other provisions
includes a reference to the provisions, as in force from time to
time, of Ordinance No. 30D.

SCHEDULE 15
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE MOTOR DEALERS ACT 1974
Section 40 (3)—

Omit “the commencement of section 97, insert instead *“1 May
1975”.




85

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 16
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE NECROPOLIS ACT 1901

(1) Headings—

Omit the headings appearing before sections 1, 7, 13, 14, 15 and
28.

(2) Section 28—
Omit “$100”, insert instead “$500”.

(3) Sections 29, 30—

Omit “or plant” wherever occurring, insert instead “plant flower
token or tnibute”.

(4) Section 29—
Omit “$200, insert instead “$1,000”.

(5) Section 32—
Omit “$40”, insert instead “$200”.

(6) Section 34 (1)—

Omit “and enclosures” , insert instead “‘enclosures flowers tokens
and tributes”.

(7) (a) Section 37 (2) (¢)—

Omit * and enclosures”, insert instead ‘, enclosures, flowers,
tokens and tributes’.

(b) Section 37 (3)—
Omit “$200”, insert instead “$1,000".




86 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 17
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE NOXIOUS INSECTS ACT 1934
Section 7 (2)—

After “The board”, insert “, or any person authorised by the
board to issue an order,”.

SCHEDULE 18
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PARLIAMENTARY ELECTORATES AND
ELECTIONS ACT 1912

(1) Section 20 (1) (a) (it)—
Omit the subparagraph, insert instead:

(ii) a person (other than an Australian citizen) who would, if
the relevant Commonwealth law had continued in force,
be a person who has the status of a British subject and who
was, immediately before 26 January 1984, enrolled as an
elector for the Legislative Assembly or enrolled in any
other State or any Territory of the Commonwealth as an
elector for the House of Representatives; and

(2) Section 20 (3)—
After section 20 (2), insert:
(3) In this section—

“relevant Commonwealth law’> means the Australian
Citizenship Act 1948 of the Commonwealth as amended
and in force immediately before the commencement of
Schedule 18 to the Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions)
Act 1985 and the regulations in force immediately before
that commencement under the Australian Citizenship Act
1948 of the Commonwealth as so amended and in force.




87

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 19
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PASTURES PROTECTION ACT 1934

(1) (a) Section 24 (1), (2)—

Omit “‘secretary rangers rabbit inspectors” wherever occurring,
insert instead ‘‘secretary, rangers, noxious animal inspectors”.

(b) Section 24 (1)—

Omit “rabbit inspector”, insert instead ‘‘noxious animal
inspector”.

(c) Section 24 (3)—

Omit ““secretary ranger or rabbit inspector” wherever occurring,
insert instead ‘‘secretary, ranger or noxious animal inspector”.

(d) Section 24 (4)—
After section 24 (3), insert:

(4) A reference in any other Act and in any instrument or
document of any kind to a rabbit inspector shall be read as a
reference to a noxious animal inspector.

(2) Section 468 (2) (b) (as inserted by the Pastures Protection
(Amendment) Act 1985)—
Omit “rabbit inspector”, insert instead ‘‘noxious animal
inspector”.
(3) Sections 82 (4), 169 (2) (h), (h1) (i1), (3) (b)—

Omit “rabbit inspector” wherever occurring, insert instead
“noxious animal inspector™.

SCHEDULE 20
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRISONS ACT 1952

(1) (a) Section 4, definition of “‘prisoner”—

Omit “(a) to (d) inclusive”, insert instead “‘(a) and (¢)”.



88 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 20—-continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRISONS ACT 1952—continued

(b) Section 4 (2)—
At the end of section 4, insert:
(2) A reference in any other Act or in any instrument—

(a) to the Comptroller-General of Prisons, the Deputy
Comptroller-General of Prisons, the Commissioner of
Corrective Services or the Deputy Commissioner of
Corrective Services shall be read as a reference to the
Corrective Services Commission of New South Wales; or

(b) to the Department of Prisons shall be read as a reference
to the Department of Corrective Services.
(2) (a) Section 59 (2)—
Omit **97, insert instead “10”.
(b) Section 59 (2) (a)—
Omit “6”, insert instead “7”.
(c) Section 59 (3) (a)—
Omit the paragraph, insert instead:
(a) 2 shall be Judges of the District Court, of whom—

(1) 1 shall, in and by the instrument by which the
member is appointed or by another instrument
executed by the Governor, be appointed as
Chairman of the Board; and

(11) the other shall, in and by the instrument by which
the member is appointed, be appointed as Deputy
Chairman of the Board;

(d) Section 59 (5)—

Omit the subsection.

(3) Section 61 (1)—

After “Chairman of the Board”, insert “or the Deputy Chairman
of the Board”.



89

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 20—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRISONS ACT 1952—continued

(4) (a) Schedule 5, clause 2 (1)—
After “Board”, insert “‘(other than the Chairman of the Board)”.
(b) Schedule 5, clause 2 (1a)—
After clause 2 (1), insert:

(1A) The Deputy Chairman of the Board shall, during the
illness or absence of the Chairman of the Board, act in the office
of the Chairman and shall have and may exercise and perform
all the powers, authorities, duties and functions of the Chairman.

(c) Schedule 5, clause 2 (2), (3)—

Omit “Chairman” wherever occurring, insert instead “Deputy
Chairman”.

(5) (a) Schedule 5, clause 4 (2), (3)—

Omit “or the Chairman” wherever occurring, insert instead “, the
Chairman of the Board or the Deputy Chairman”.

(b) Schedule 5, clause 4 (3)—

Omit “member or Chairman”, insert instead ‘“member,
Chairman or Deputy Chairman”.

(c) Schedule 35, clause 4 (4) (a)—
After “Chairman”, insert “‘or the Deputy Chairman”.
(d) Schedule 5, clause 4 (4) (a)—
Omit ““and”.
(e) Schedule 5, clause 4 (4) (b), (¢)—
At the end of clause 4 (4) (b), insert:
; and

(c) areference to the Deputy Chairman of the Board includes
a reference to a person acting in the office of the Deputy
Chairman of the Board.



90 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 20—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRISONS ACT 1952—continued

(6) Schedule 5, clause 6—

Omit the clause, insert instead:

Presiding member

6. The Chairman of the Board or, in the absence of the
Chairman, the Deputy Chairman of the Board shall preside at a
meeting of the Board.

(7) (a) Schedule 5, clause 7 (1)—

After “members”, insert “(including the Chairman of the Board
or the Deputy Chairman of the Board and including 4 other
members of the Board)”.

(b) Schedule 5, clause 7 (24)—
After clause 7 (2), insert:

(2A) Where the Chairman of the Board and the Deputy
Chairman of the Board are both present at a meeting of the
Board only the Chairman is entitled to vote with respect to any
decision.

(8) Schedule 5, clause 8 (1) (f) (i)—

Omit “the member”, insert instead ‘“‘a member”.

SCHEDULE 21
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE PROBATION AND PAROLE ACT 1983

(1) Section 4 (1), definition of “judicial member of the Board”—

Omit “the Deputy”, insert instead ““a Deputy”.



91

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 21 —continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE PROBATION AND PAROLE ACT 1983~
continued

(2) Schedule 1, clauses 1, 9 (3) (b), 13—
Omit “the Deputy” wherever occurring, insert instead ‘“a
Deputy”.
(3) (a) Schedule 1, clause 2 (1)—
Omit “7”, insert instead “8”.
(b) Schedule 1, clause 2 (2) (a)—
Omit “2”, insert instead “3”.
(¢) Schedule 1, clause 2 (2) (a) (ii))—
Omit the subparagraph, insert instead:

(i1) 2 shall, in and by the instruments by which the members
are appointed, be appointed as Deputy Chairmen of the
Board;
(4) Schedule 1, clauses 2 (4)-(6), 3 (5) (a)—

Omit “Deputy” wherever occurring, insert instead ‘“a Deputy”.

(5) (a) Schedule 1, clause 3 (1)—
Omit “The Deputy”, insert instead ‘“A Deputy”.
(b) Schedule 1, clause 3 (1a)—
After clause 3 (1), insert:

(1A) The question of which Deputy Chairman shall, during the
illness or absence of the Chairman, act in the office of the
Chairman may be determined by the Board.

(6) Schedule 1, clause 3 (2)—

Omit “the Deputy” where firstly occurring, insert instead “‘a
Deputy”.



92 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 21—continued

AMENDMENTS TO THE PROBATION AND PAROLE ACT 1983—
continued

(7) Schedule 1, clause 5 (b)—
Omit “the Deputy” where firstly occurring, insert instead “a
Deputy”.

(8) Schedule 1, clause 14—

Omit “the Deputy Chairman are both™, insert instead ‘“‘one or
both of the Deputy Chairmen is or are”.

SCHEDULE 22
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE PUBLIC HEALTH ACT 1902

Section 71A (1), (1A)—
Omit section 71A (1), insert instead:
(1) In this Part—
“dangerous substance” includes—
(a) hydrocyanic acid; and

(b) any other substance declared to be a dangerous
substance for the purposes of this Part by a
proclamation made under subsection (1a);

“officer” includes an officer of the Department of Industrial
Relations;

“Secretary” means the Secretary of the Department of
Industrial Relations.

(1A) The Governor may, by proclamation published in the
Gazette, declare a substance to be a dangerous substance for the
purposes of this Part.

SCHEDULE 23
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE PUBLIC NOTARIES ACT 1985



93

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

Section 6—

After “or by”, insert ““solicitor or”.

SCHEDULE 24
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE SECOND-HAND DEALERS AND
COLLECTORS (AMENDMENT) ACT 1985

Schedule 1 (5) (e)—

Omit *“14 days”, insert instead “, in the case of goods (or goods
of a class or quantity) prescribed for the purposes of this
subsection, 5 days or, in any other case, 14 days”.

SCHEDULE 25
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE STAMP DUTIES ACT 1920

Second Schedule—

After “may not have” in paragraph (2) (a) of the matter
appearing under the heading “DECLARATION OF TRUST”,
insert “‘joined therein or”.

SCHEDULE 26
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE STOCK DISEASES ACT 1923



94 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

Section 8 (1) (a)—

Omit “treated”, insert instead “identified or treated”.

SCHEDULE 27
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE SURVEYORS ACT 1929

(1) Section 3, definition of “Articles”—
Omit the definition.

(2) Section 5—

Omit “councii of the institution”, insert instead “‘Institution”.

(3) (a) Section 6 (4)—
Omit “the council of”.
(b) Section 6 (4)—

Omit “such council”, insert instead ‘‘the Institution”.
(4) Section 8 (3)—

Omit “January”, insert instead “April”.
(5) Section 9 (b)—

Omit “, as amended by subsequent Acts”.

(6) (a) Section 98B (1) (b)—
Omit “‘subsection (4) of section 14, insert instead “section 14
(4)”.
(b) Section 9B (2)—
Omit “subsection (6) of section 107, insert instead “section 10
(6)”.
(7) (a) Section 10 (2) (d)—

Omit “completed such field service”, insert instead “gained such
practical experience”.



95

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 27—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE SURVEYORS ACT 1929—continued

(b) Section 10 (4), (5)—
Omit “July” wherever occurring, insert instead “February”.
(c) Section 10 (5)—

Omit “thirty-first day of October” wherever occurring, insert
instead *‘last day of March”.

(d) Section 10 (8)—

Omit “ten dollars”, insert instead “$50”.

(8) (a) Section 12 (2)—
Omit “‘three hundred dollars”, insert instead ““$2,000”.
(b) Section 12 (3) (a)—
Omit the paragraph, insert instead:

(a) a person who is enrolled as a candidate in accordance with
the regulations and is gaining practical experience under
the supervision of a surveyor;

(9) Section 13 (2)—

Omit “one hundred dollars”, insert instead “$500”.

(10) (a) Section 14 (2) (a)—
Omit “‘three hundred dollars™, insert instead “$2,000”.
(b) Section 14 (5)—

Omit “three hundred dollars, and a further penalty not exceeding
twenty dollars for every day during which the offence is
continued”, insert instead “$2,000”.

(11) Section 15 (1)—

Omit * the council of™.

(12) Section 18 (2)—

Omit “one hundred dollars”, insert instead “$500.



96 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 27—continued
AMENDMENTS TO THE SURVEYORS ACT 1929—-continued

(13) Section 22—
Omit “stipendiary or police magistrate or any two justices in

petty sessions’, insert instead ‘“Magistrate or any two Justices
sitting or acting as a Local Court™.

(14) (a) Section 23 (1) (i)—
Omit the paragraph.
(b) Section 23 (2)—
Omit “one hundred dollars”, insert instead ““$500”".
(c) Section 23 (3)—

Omit “*practice”, insert instead *‘practice,”.

(d) Section 23 (4)—
Omuit the subsection, insert instead:
(4) Section 41 of the Interpretation Act 1897 applies in respect

of a regulation as if this Act had been passed after the
commencement of the Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1969.

(15) Section 26 (1)—

Omit “registered”.

SCHEDULE 28
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENT TO THE TRUSTEE COMPANIES ACT 1964

51011-09218--88



97

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

Section 31 (5), (6)—
Omit section 31 (5), insert instead:

(5) At least 3 directors of every trustee company shall be
natural persons who ordinarily reside within Australia.

(6) One of the directors referred to in subsection (5) shall,
where a trustee company has a managing director, be the
managing director.

SCHEDULE 29
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO THE VALUERS REGISTRATION ACT
1975
(1) Section 3—

Omuit the section.

(25 Section 30A—

After section 30 insert:

Provision relating to Valuers Registration Regulation
30a. (1) In this section—

“application” means an application under section 13 for
registration as an associate real estate valuer, a practising
real estate valuer, an associate valuer of licensed premises
or a valuer of licensed premises;

“Regulation” means the regulation made under this Act and
published in Gazette No. 73 of 26 April 1985 at page
1804.

(2) Notwithstanding the publication of the Regulation in the
Gazette on 1 May 1985 the Regulation shall be deemed to have
had effect on and from but not before 1 July 1985.

SCHEDULE 30
(Sec. )

AMENDMENT TO THE WELLINGTON SHOWGROUND
ACT 1929



98 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

Section 9 (2)—
Omit “twenty dollars”, insert instead “$500”.

SCHEDULE 31
(Sec. 5)

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION

Administration of Justice Act 1924 No. 42—
Section 3 (1), definition of “‘Judgment”—

Omit * a ‘foreign award’ within the meaning of section 56 (1), insert instead
*“a foreign award enforceable by virtue of Part VII”.

Benevolent Society of New South Wales Act of 1902 No. 97—
Section 1—

Omit “of” where secondly occurring.

Bills of Sale Act of 1898 No. 10—
Section 1—

Omit “of” where secondly occurring.

Commercial Tribunal Act 1984 No. 98—
Section 27 (2)—

Omit “true copy and”, insert instead ‘‘true copy, and a copy of”".

Compensation to Relatives Act of 1897 No. 31—
Section 1—

Omit “of™.
Consumer Protection Act 1969 No. 28—
(1) Section 52 (3) (d), (e)—
Omit “-1966" wherever occurring.
(2) Section 58a (2)—

Omit “section 362 of the Companies Act 19617, insert instead “section 528
of the Companies (New South Wales) Code™.

Contractors’ Debts Act of 1897 No. 29—
Section 1—

Omit “of™.



99

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

Crimes Act 1900 No. 40—
(1) (a) Section 104—

After “shall include”, insert “offences under sections 61B-61D,”.
(b) Section 104—
Omit “such crime” wherever occurring, insert instead “such offence or cnime™.
(2) Section 4408 (1)—
Omit “, rape,”.
Criminal Injuries Compensation Act 1967 No. 14—
(1) Section 2, definition of “Under Secretary”—
(a) Omit “Under” wherever occurring.

(b) Omit “Department of the Attorney General™, insert instead “‘Attorney
General’s Department’.

(2) Sections 3, 4 (3), 5,6, T—
Omit “Under” wherever occurring.
Electricity Commission (Amendment) Act 1982 No. 63—
(1) Section 7—

Omit the section.
(2) Schedule 4, clauses 2 (2)., 6—

After ““Minister” wherever occurring, insert “‘administering the Electricity
Commission Act 1950

Farm Produce Act 1983 No. 30—
Section 19 (3) (a) (i1)—
Omit “disqualificaton™, insert instead ‘“‘disqualification’.
Foreign Judgments (Reciprocal Enforcement) Act 1973 No. 39—
Section 4 (1), definition of “judgment”—

Omit “a ‘foreign award’ within the meaning of section 56 (1), insert instead
“a foreign award enforceable by virtue of Part VII™.

Gas and Electricity Act 1935 No. 42—
Section 2 (5)—

After section 2 (4), insert:



100 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(5) The references, in Schedules 3 and 6, to the City of Sydney shall be
read as references to the united area, within the meaning of the Local
Government (City of Sydney Boundaries) Act 1981.

Growth Centres (Development Corporations) Act 1974 No. 49—
(1) Section 43—
After section 42, insert:

Savings, transitional and other provisions
43. Schedule 6 has effect.
(2) Schedule 6—
After Schedule 5, insert:

SCHEDULE 6
(Sec. 43)
SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS

1. A reference in any other Act or statutory instrument, or in any other
instrument, or in any contract or agreement, to the Deputy Chairman of a
corporation shall be read as a reference to the General Manager.

Hay Irrigation Act 1902 Neo. 57—
Section 17a (4) (a)—

Omit “, as amended by subsequent Acts,”.

Hunter District Water, Sewerage and Drainage Act 1938 No. 11—
(1) Section 2—

Omit the section.
(2) Section 12—

Omit “‘paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section 8, insert instead “‘section 8

(1) (o).
(3) Section 13—

Omit “subsection (1) of section 87, insert instead “section 8 (1)”.
(4) Section 30 (2)—

Omit ““the last preceding subsection”, insert instead ‘“‘subsection (1)”.
(5) (a) Section 344 (2)—

Omit “State Planning Authority of New South Wales” wherever occurring,
insert instead “Director of Environment and Planning™.



101

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(b) Section 34a (4)—
Omit “paragraph (b) of subsection (3)”, insert instead *‘subsection (3) (b)”.
(6) (a) Section 34B (1)—

Omit “as amended by subsequent Acts, by the council of the municipality or
shire in which the land is situated, or an award, other than an award
disallowing the decision or all of the decisions appealed from, as the case may
be, has been made under subsection (1) of section 341L of that Act, as so
amended, by the Board of Subdivision Appeals in respect of any such land,
the applicant to whom any such approval was given or in whose favour any
such award was made”, insert instead ‘“‘the applicant to whom the approval
was given”.

(b) Section 34B (3)—

Omit “‘paragraph (b) or (c) of subsection (2)”, insert instead “subsection (2)
(b) or (c)”.

(¢) Section 34B (4)—
Omit *“‘paragraph (a) of subsection (2)”, insert instead ‘“‘subsection (2) (a)”".
(d) Section 34B (4)—

Omit “paragraph (b) or (c) of the said subsection (2)”, insert instead
“subsection (2) (b) or (c)”.

(e) Section 348 (5), (5A)—
Omit section 34B (5), insert instead:

(5) The board shall not serve a notice under subsection (2) (b) (ii) or (ii1),
or under subsection (2) (c), requiring the applicant for a certificate under this
section to enter into an agreement under section 34A for the construction of
a water or sewer main, or both, or any ancillary works, to serve any land
unless—

(a) it has referred to the Director of Environment and Planning a copy of
the plan of subdivision in relation to which the applicant has applied
for a certificate; and

(b) the Director of Environment and Planning has issued to the board a
certificate under section 34a (2) in respect of the construction of the
water or sewer main, or both, as the case may be, and ancillary works.

(5A) The Director of Environment and Planning shall, within 20 days after
receiving a copy of a plan of subdivision referred by the board, either—



102 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31 —continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(a) inform the board that a certificate under section 34a (2) is not proposed
to be issued in relation to the land comprised in the plan; or

(b) issue such a certificate in respect of the construction of a water or sewer
main, or both, and any necessary ancillary works, to serve the land or
any part thereof, either alone or together with other lands.

(f) Section 34B (6)—

Omit “‘subparagraph (i) of paragraph (b) of subsection (2)”, insert instead
“subsection (2) (b) (i)".

(7) Section 35 (3)—
Omit “the next preceding subsection”, insert instead “‘subsection (2)”.
(8) Section 37—
Omit *, as amended by subsequent Acts,”.
(9) Section 53 (f)—
Omit “‘subsection (3) of section 517, insert instead “‘section 51 (3)".
(10) (a) Section 55 (5) (a)—
Omit “-1935".
(b) Section 55 (5) (¢)—
Omit “-1934".
(c) Section 55 (5) (f)—
Omit “-1936".
(11) Section 56 (4)—
Omit “‘the Public Trusts Act, 1897, the Public Parks Act, 1912, or™.
(12) (a) Section 66 (2)—
Omit “‘paragraph (a) of subsection (1), insert instead ‘‘subsection (1) (a)”.
(b) Section 66 (2) (a)—
Omit “paragraph (b) of that subsection™, insert instead *‘subsection (1) (b)”.
(c) Section 66 (2) (b)—

Omit “paragraph (c) of that subsection”, insert instead **subsection (1) (c)”.



103

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(d) Section 66 (2) (¢)—

Omit “paragraph (e) of that subsection”, insert instead ‘‘subsection (1) (e)”.
(e) Section 66 (3)—

Omit “*paragraph (a) of subsection (1), insert instead ““subsection (1) (a)”.
(f) Section 66 (4)—

Omit “‘paragraph (a) of that subsection”, insert instead ‘‘subsection (1) (a)”.
(g) Section 66 (4) (a)—

Omit “*paragraph (b) of that subsection”, insert instead “‘subsection (1) (b)”.
(h) Section 66 (4) (b)—

Omit “‘paragraph (c) of that subsection”, insert instead “‘subsection (1) (c¢)”.
(1) Section 66 (4) (¢)—

Omit “paragraph (e) of that subsection”, insert instead ‘“‘subsection (1) (e)”.
(J) Section 66 (5)—

Omit “*paragraph (a) of that subsection”, insert instead *““subsection (1) (a)”.

(13) (a) Section 66A (1)—

Omit “‘subsection (1) of section 66”, insert instead *‘section 66 (1)”.
(b) Section 66a (1)—

Omit “‘paragraph (a) of that subsection™, insert instead ‘‘section 66 (1) (a)”.
(c) Section 66a (2)—

Omit “‘paragraph (e) of subsection (1) of section 66, insert instead “‘section
66 (1) (e)”.

(d) Section 66a (3)—

Omit “Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section 66, insert instead “*Section
66 (1) (c)”.

(14) Section 66B—

Omit “*paragraph (h) of subsection (1) of section 66, insert instead *‘section
66 (1) (h)”.



104 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(15) (a) Section 68 (1)—

Omit “the thirtieth day of June, one thousand nine hundred and thirty-eight”,
insert instead 30 June 1938”.

(b) Section 68 (1)—
Omit “the next subsection”, insert instead “‘subsection (2)”.
(c) Section 68 (2)—

Omit *‘the first day of July, one thousand nine hundred and thirty-nine”,
insert instead **1 July 1939”.

(d) Section 68 (3)—

Omit “the first day of July, one thousand nine hundred and thirty-eight”,
insert instead ““1 July 1938,

(16) (a) Section 91 (2)—
Omit “Paragraph (f) of subsection (1), insert instead “‘Subsection (1) (f)”.
(b) Section 91 (3)—
Omit “-1934".
(17) Section 97 (1a)—

Omit “‘paragraph (a) of subsection (1) wherever occurring, insert instead
“subsection (1) (a)”.

(18) Section 100 (4)—
Omit “paragraph (b) of subsection (1), insert instead ‘‘subsection (1) (b)”.
(19) Section 104a (3), (5)—

Omit “the first day of July in the year one thousand nine hundred and
seventy-one” wherever occurring, insert instead “1 July 1971,

(20) (a) Section 104aa (3)—
Omit “‘subsection (7) of section 100”, insert instead “section 100 (7).
(b) Section 104aa (3) (a)—
Omit “one thousand nine hundred and seventy-two”, insert instead 1972,
(c) Section 104aa (3) (a)—

Omit “‘subsection (8) of section 1007, insert instead “‘section 100 (8)”.



105

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(21) Section 131—
Omit the section, insert instead:
Gazettal, etc., of regulations and by-laws

131. Section 41 of the Interpretation Act 1897 applies in respect of a
regulation or a by-law as if this Act had been passed after the commencement
of the Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1969.

(22) Section 134 (7) (a)—

Omit “paragraphs (a) (b) and (c) of subsection (6)”, insert instead *“subsection
(6) (a), (b) and (c)”.

(23) Section 149 (3)—
Omit “-1934”,
(24) Section 150 (4)—
Omit “-1934” wherever occurring.

Juvenile Smoking Suppression Act of 1903 No. 11—
Section 3—

Omit “of.
Liens on Crops and Wool and Stock Mortgages Act of 1898 No. 7—
Section 1—
Omit the section, insert instead:
Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the “Liens on Crops and Wool and Stock
Mortgages Act 1898”.

Miscellaneous Acts (Coal Mines Regulation) Repeal and Amendment Act 1982 No. 69—
(1) Schedule 4, clause 8—

After “Minister” wherever occurring, insert “administering the Principal Act”.
(2) Schedule 4, clause 10 (4)—(6)—

After “Minister” wherever occurring, insert “administering the 1912 Act”.
(3) Schedule 4, clause 10 (7), (8)—

After “Minister” wherever occurring, insert “administering the Coal Mining
Act 1973



106 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31-—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

Miscellaneous Acts (Community Welfare) Repeal and Amendment Act 1982 No. 88—
(1) (a) Schedule 2, clause 7 (a)— '

After “Minister” where firstly occurring, insert “administering the Community
Welfare Act 1982,

(b) Schedule 2, clause 7 (a)—

After “Minister” where secondly occurring, insert “‘administering the Child
Welfare Act™.

(2) Schedule 2, clause 8—

After “Minister” wherever occurring, insert “administering the Child Welfare
Act”.

(3) (a) Schedule 2, clause 19 (a)—

After “Minister” where firstly occurring, insert “administering the Community
Weifare Act 1982,

(b) Schedule 2, clause 19 (a)—

After “Minister” where secondly occurring, insert “‘administering the Child
Welfare Act™.

(4) Schedule 2, clause 28—
After “Minister”, insert “administering the Community Welfare Act 1982".

Miscellaneous Acts (Planning) Repeal and Amendment Act 1979 No. 205—
Schedule 3, clauses 2 (2), 3, 21 (1)—

After “Minister” wherever occurring, insert “administering the Environmental
Planning and Assessment Act 1979.

Motor Vehicles (Third Party Insurance) Act 1942 No. 15—
Section 12 (5) (a)—

Omit “or section 35”.

Museum of Applied Arts and Sciences Act 1945 No. 31—
(1) Section 19—

After section 18, insert:
Savings, transitional and other provisions

19. Schedule 1 has effect.



107

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(2) Schedule 1—
At the end of the Act, insert:

SCHEDULE
(Sec. 19)

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS
References to Museum of Technology and Applied Science

1. A reference in any other Act or any instrument or document of any kind
to the Museum of Technology and Applied Science shall be read as a reference
to the Museum of Applied Arts and Sciences.

Oaths Act 1900 No. 20—
(1) Part 1, heading—

Omit “Preliminary”’, insert instead “PRELIMINARY™.
(2) Part 11, heading—

Omit “QOaths”, insert instead “OATHS”.
(3) Part II1, heading—

Omit “Affirmations’, insert instead “AFFIRMATIONS”.
(4) Part IV, heading—

Omit  “Sratutory declarations”, insert instead “STATUTORY
DECLARATIONS”.

(5) Part V, heading—
Omit “Affidavits”, insert instead “AFFIDAVITS”.
Police Regulation Act 1899 No. 20—
Section 3 (2)—
At the end of section 3, insert:

(2) A reference in this or any other Act, or in any instrument or document
of any kind, however expressed, to a member of the police force who is a
superintendent, inspector, sergeant or constable includes, and shall be deemed
always to have included, a reference to a member of the police force who is
a superintendent, inspector, sergeant or constable, as the case may be, of any
grade.



108 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

Private Irrigation Districts Act 1973 No. 47—

(1) (a) Section 4 (1), definition of ‘“authority”—
Before the definition of “Board”, insert:

“authority” means an authority or amended authority issued under Division
4 of Part II of the Water Act 1912;

(b) Section 4 (1), definition of ““joint water supply scheme authority”—
Omit the definition.
(2) Sections 5 (2) (¢) (iv), 9 (2) (c) (iii)—
Omit “license or permit issued under Part II of the Water Act, 1912, license
issued under Part V of that Act, or joint water supply scheme authority”
wherever occurring, insert instead “authority, or license or permit issued

under Part I of the Water Act 1912, or license issued under Part V of that
Act”.

(3) Section 14 (3) (¢)—

Omit “license or permit issued under Part Il of the Water Act, 1912, license
under Part V of that Act, or joint water supply scheme authority”, insert
instead “authority, or license or permit issued under Part II of the Water Act
1912, or license issued under Part V of that Act”.

Public Instruction Act of 1880, 43 Vic. No. 23—
(1) Section 39 (2)—

At the end of section 39, insert:
(2) Schedule 1 has effect.
(2) Section 40—
Omit “of”” where secondly occurring.
(3) Schedule 1—

After section 40, insert:



109

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

SCHEDULE 1
(Sec. 39 (2))

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS
References to Minister of Public Instruction, etc.

1. A reference in any Act or in any instrument or document of any kind
to—

(a) the Minister of Public Instruction, shall be read as a reference to the
Minister administering this Act; and

(b) the Department of Public Instruction, shall be read as a reference to the
Department with the administration of which the Minister who for the
time being was administering this Act was charged.

Rural Assistance Act 1932 No. 33—
Section 341 (1), (2), (3) (¢)—

Omit “Colonial Treasurer” wherever occurring, insert instead “State
Treasurer”.

Sporting Injuries Insurance Act 1978 No. 141—
(1) Section 13—

Omit the section, insert instead:
Financial year of the Committee
13. The financial year of the Committee shall be—

(a) where no period is prescribed as referred to in paragraph (b)—the year
commencing on 1 July; or

(b) the period prescribed for the purposes of this section.
(2) (a) Section 31 (1) (d)—
Omit the paragraph, insert instead:

(d) the giving. of notice of injuries suffered in the course of sporting or
athletic activities, or recreational activities conducted or promoted by
the Department, and the keeping of records of any such injuries;

(b) Section 31 (2) (d)—
Omit the paragraph, insert instead:
(d) authorise the Commitiee to determine—

(1) that an activity of a kind described by the Committee shall, for the



110 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

purposes of this Act, be deemed to be an authorised activity of a
prescribed organisation specified by the Committee for a period so
specified, which period may have wholly or partly occurred before
the date of the determination; or

(i) that a person who was not a registered player of a sporting
organisation, an enrolled player of a school or an enrolled participant
of the Department at a time or during a period before the
determination is made shall be treated as a registered player of the
sporting organisation, an enrolled player of the school or an enrolled
participant of the Department, as the case may require, at that time
or during that period,

State Development and Country Industries Assistance Act 1966 No. 10—
(1) Section ! (3)—

Omit the subsection.
(2) Section 3, definitions of “Area”, “Council”—
Omit “, as amended by subsequent Acts” wherever occurring.
(3) (a) Section 4 (9)—
Omit “, 1902, as amended by subsequent Acts,”, insert instead “1979”.
(b) Section 4 (9)—
Omit “, as so amended,”.
(4) Section 5 (1) (d)—
Omit ““, as amended by subsequent Acts”.
(5) (a) Section 12 (1) (e)—
Omit “subsection (3) of section 14”, insert instead *‘section 14 (3)”.
(b) Section 12 (4)—

Omit “in paragraph (d) of subsection (1)”, insert instead “by subsection (1)
(d)”.

(c) Section 12 (4)—
Omit “Revenue”.
(6) (a) Section 20 (1) (d)—

Omit “Co-operation, Community Settlement, and Credit Act, 1923, as
amended by subsequent Acts™, insert instead ““Co-operation Act 1923,



111

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(b) Section 20 (5)—

Omit “paragraph (a), (c) or (cl) of subsection (1), insert instead ‘“‘subsection

(1) (a), (c) or (c1)”.
(7) (a) Section 21 (2) (a)—

Omit “paragraph (d) of subsection (1) of section 207, insert instead “‘section
20 (1) (d)”.

(b) Section 21 (2) (b)—

Omit “paragraph (d) or (e) of subsection (1) of section 20”, insert instead
“section 20 (1) (d) or (e)”.

(8) Section 31 (3)—
Omit “paragraph (b) of subsection (2)”, insert instead “subsection (2) (b)”.
(9) Section 34a (2)—
Omit “‘paragraph (c) of subsection (1), insert instead “‘subsection (1) (c)”.
(10) Section 34D (2)—

Omit ““the Public Parks Act, 1912, insert instead “Part IIIB of the Crown
Lands Consolidation Act 1913”.

(11) Section 34F—

Omit “paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of section 34A” wherever occurring,
insert instead ‘“‘section 34a (1) (a)”.

(12) Section 34G (2)—

Omit “paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section 34A”, insert instead “‘section
34a (1) (¢)”.

(13) Section 35 (2), (3)—
Omit the subsections, insert instead:

(2) Section 41 of the Interpretation Act 1897 applies in respect of a
regulation as if this Act had been passed after the commencement of the
Interpretation (Amendment) Act 1969.

State Transport (Co-ordination) Act 1931 No. 32—
(1) Section 51—

After section 50, insert:



112 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1 985

SCHEDULE 31—continued
AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

Savings, transitional and other provisions

51. Schedule 5 has effect.
(2) Schedule 5—

After Schedule 4, insert:

SCHEDULE 5
(Sec. 51)

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS
References to State Transport (Co-ordination) Fund

1. A reference, however expressed, in any Act or in an instrument or
document, of any kind, to the State Transport (Co-ordination) Fund
established under this Act as in force immediately before the commencement
of the State Transport (Co-ordination) Amendment Act 1982 shall be read as
a reference to the Road Transport and Traffic Fund established under the

Transport Act 1930.

Statutory and Other Offices Remuneration Act 1975 (1976 No. 4)—
Schedule 2, Part 1—

Omit “Secretary of the Department of Health.”.
Sydney Turf Club Act 1943 No. 22—
(1) Long title—
Omit “-1938".
(2) Section 3, definition of ‘““Race meeting”—
Omit “-1938".
(3) Sections 5 (5), 7 (1) (c), 13 (9), 14 (3)—
Omit *, as amended by subsequent Acts” wherever occurring.
(4) Section 8 (2)—
Omit “Colonial”.
(5) Section 11 (1) (c)—

Omit “subsection (10) of section 6 of the Workers’ Compensation Act,
1926-1942”, insert instead “section 6 (10) of the Workers’ Compensation Act
1926,

(6) Section 12 (1)—
Omit “-1942".



113

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued

AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—
continued

(7) Section 14 (4)—

Omit “Fourth and Fifth Schedules to the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, as
amended by subsequent Acts and this Act,”, insert instead “Fourth Schedule
to the Gaming and Betting Act 1912,

The Synod of Eastern Australia Property Act of 1918—
Section 17—

Omit “of” where secondly occurring.

Trading Stamps Act 1972 No. 44—
Section 6 (3)—

Omit “Labour and Industry”, insert instead *“Consumer Affairs™.

Transport Act 1930 No. 18—
(1) Section 264 (1) (bc)-(bt)—

Omit “for”” where firstly occurring in each paragraph.
(2) Section 264 (1) (bf), (bo)—

Omit ““for” where secondly occurring in each paragraph.
(3) Section 264 (1) (bt)—

Omit “generally with regard to”.

Truck Act of 1900 No. 55—
Section 13—

Omit “‘of” where secondly occurring.

Valuation of Land Act 1916 No. 2—
(1) Section 9 (2)—

Omit the subsection.
(2) Section 47—

Omit “Hunter Valley Conservation Trust.”.
(3) Section 56—

Omit “card, folder, or book form, as may be”, insert instead “‘such form as
may be”.



114 Act No. 231

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 31—continued
AMENDMENTS TO OTHER ACTS BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—

continued
(4) Section 58c (1), definition of “residential land”—

From paragraph (b), omit “not exceeding six acres in area”, insert instead
“not exceeding 2.428 hectares in area”.

Warehousemen’s Liens Act 1935 No. 19—
Section 6 (6)—

Omit “court of petty sessions holden before a stipendiary or police
magistrate”, insert instead “Local Court constituted by a Magistrate”.

Wentworth Irrigation Act 54 Vic. No. 7 (1290)—
(1) Section 1—

Omit “Wentworth Irrigation Act”, insert instead “Wentworth Irrigation Act
1890”.

(2) Section 224 (4), (6), (T)—

Omit “subsection three of this section” wherever occurring, insert instead
“subsection (3).

(3) Section 22A (4)—

Omit “, as amended by subsequent Acts,”.
(4) Section 22a (8)—

Omit “subsection one of this section”, insert instead “subsection (1)”.
(5) Section 22A (10)—

Omit “subsections six, seven, eight and nine of this section™, insert instead
““subsections (6), (7), (8) and (9)”.

SCHEDULE 32
(Sec. 6)

SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS



115

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

Savings relating to repealed enactments
1. The repeal by this Act of any enactment does not affect —

(a) the proof of any past act or thing;
(b) the continuity, or status as a legal entity, of any body;

(c) any duty, obligation, liability, benefit, privilege or right saved by the operation
of the enactment; or

(d) any amendment or validation made by the enactment.

Interpretation Act 1897

2. The savings contained in this Schedule do not limit any saving in the Interpretation
Act 1897.

Transfer of assets, etc., on repeal of Argentine Ant Eradication Act 1962
3. (1) In this clause, “repealed Act” means the Argentine Ant Eradication Act 1962.

(2) On and from the commencement of this Act, all personal property vested in
the Minister administering the Argentine Ant Eradication Act 1962 under section 6 of
the repealed Act shall vest in the Minister administering the Plant Diseases Act 1924
for the purposes of that Act.

(3) The Treasurer may direct that the account called the Argentine Ant Eradication
Campaign Fund, required to be kept in the Special Deposits Account under section 15
of the repealed Act, be closed.

(4) Where the account referred to in subclause (3) is closed any money paid into
the account shall be paid into the Consolidated Fund.

Amendment to Noxious Insects Act 1934

4. A regulation made under section 7 (2) of the Noxious Insects Act 1934 and in force
immediately before the commencement of this Act shall, on that commencement, be
deemed to have been made under section 7 (2) of that Act, as amended by this Act.

Rabbit inspectors

5. A person holding office as a rabbit inspector under the Pastures Protection Act 1934
as in force immediately before the commencement of this Act shall be deemed to have
been duly appointed on that commencement as a noxious animal inspector under that
Act, as amended by this Act, on the same terms and conditions (including any as to the
term of office of the person) as those applicable to the person immediately before that
day.

Chairman of Release on Licence Board

6. The amendments made to the Prisons Act 1952 by this Act do not affect the term
of office of the person appointed as a member of the Release on Licence Board under
section 59 (3) (a) of the Prisons Act 1952, as in force immediately before the
commencement of this Act, and that person shall continue to hold office as Chairman
of the Board until the expiration of the person’s term of office.



116 Act No. 231
Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 32—continued
SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS—continued

Declarations of dangerous substances under Public Health Act 1902
7. Any declaration in force under section 71A of the Public Health Act 1902

immediately before the commencement of Schedule 22 shall be deemed to be a
declaration made under section 71A of that Act, as amended by this Act.

Saving of certain rules under Sporting Injuries Insurance Act 1978
8. An amendment made by this Act to section 31 of the Sporting Injuries Insurance

Act 1978 does not operate so as to affect any rule made under that section and in force
immediately before the commencement of the amendment.

Metric conversion

9. The provisions of Schedule 31 amending section 58C (1) of the Valuation of Land
Act 1916 are for the purpose of metric conversion, as referred to in section 3 of the
Metric Conversion (Savings) Act 1974.

Effect of amendment of amending provisions

10. An amendment made by Schedule 31 to an amending provision (as defined by the
Reprints Act 1972) contained in an Act shall, if the amending provision has commenced
before the date of assent to this Act, be deemed to have taken effect as from the
commencement of the amending provision.

Regulations

11. (1) The Governor may make regulations containing other provisions of a savings
or transitional nature consequent on the enactment of this Act.

(2) A provision made under subclause (1) may take effect as from the date of assent
to this Act or a later date.

(3) To the extent to which a provision referred to in subclause (1) takes effect from
a date that 1s earlier than the date of its publication in the Gazette, the provision does
not operate so as—

(a) to affect, in 2 manner prejudicial to any person (other than the State or a public
authority), the rights of that person existing before the date of its publication
in the Gazette; or

(b) to impose Labilities on any person (other than the State or a public authority)
in respect of anything done or omitted to be done before the date of its
publication in the Gazette.



117

v

Statute Law (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1985

SCHEDULE 32—continued
SAVINGS, TRANSITIONAL AND OTHER PROVISIONS—continued

(4) A provision made under subclause (1) shall, if the regulations expressly so provide,
have effect notwithstanding the other clauses of this Schedule.




